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Court File No.: CV-13-10280-00CL
ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
COMMERCIAL LIST
BETWEEN:

DBDC SPADINA LTD.,
and THOSE CORPORATIONS LISTED ON SCHEDULE A HERETO

Applicants
and

NORMA WALTON, RONAULD WALTON, THE ROSE & THISTLE GROUP
LTD. and EGLINTON CASTLE INC.

Respondents
and

THOSE CORPORATIONS LISTED ON SCHEDULE B HERETO, TO BE
BOUND BY THE RESULT

AFFIDAVIT OF S. HARLAN SCHONFELD
(Sworn September 25, 2017)

I, S. HARLAN SCHONFELD, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario,

MAKE OATH AND SAY:

1. | am the President of Schonfeld Inc., the court-appointed Manager in this proceeding and
have knowledge of the facts and matters to which | hereinafter depose either through my own
knowledge or by informing myself with respect thereto in which case | have indicated the source

of my information and belief.
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2. On November 5, 2013, pursuant to an order of the Honourable Justice Newbould (the
“Appointment Order”), Schonfeld Inc. was appointed Manager of companies listed at Schedule

“B” of the Appointment Order.

3. The Manager’s mandate was further expanded to include certain other properties listed at

Schedule “C” to the Judgment and Order of Justice Brown dated August 12, 2014 (the “August

12 Order”).

4, Attached hereto and marked as Exhibit “A” to my Affidavit is a true copy of the
accounts rendered by the Manager for the period January 1, 2017 to August 31, 2017 (the

“Accounts Approval Period”) for a total of $251,692.21 inclusive of HST and disbursements.

5. A total of approximately 374.6 hours were expended by the Manager during the Accounts

Approval Period in performing services in its capacity as Manager pursuant to the Appointment

Order.

6. The hourly billing rates outlined in Exhibit “A” to this Affidavit are normal average
hourly rates charged by Schonfeld Inc. for services rendered in relation to engagements similar

to its engagement as Manager in this matter. These accounts accurately reflect the services

provided by the Manager in this matter.

SWORN BEFORE ME at the City of
Toronto, in the Province of Ontario this 25™

day of prptamber, 2017, -
/. !

A Commissibner for taking Affidavits, etc. 'S. HARLAN SCHONFELD

Christopher Patrick James Baxter, a
Commissioner, etc., Province of Ontario,
whilea Student-at-Law.

Expires April 14, 2019,
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This is Exhibit “A” referred to in the
affidavit of S. Harlan Schonfeld
sworn before me, this 25"

day of September, 2017.

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits

Christopher Patrick James Baxter, a
Commissioner, etc., Province of Ontario,
while a Student-at-Law.

Expires April 14, 2019.
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Schonfeld Inec.

Receivers+Trustees

January 27, 2017

Norma Walton, Ronauld Walton, The Rose &
Thistle Group Ltd. and Eglinton Castle Inc; and
those Corporations listed on Schedule "B" of an
an Order made on November 5, 2013; and those
Properties listed on Schedule "C" of an Order
made on August 12, 2014

30 Hazelton Avenue

Toronto, ON M5R 2E2

Invoice #1065
*INVOICE*

Re: Court Appointed Manager's account
To: Professional services rendered for the period January 1, 2017

to January 26, 2017 under the terms of an Order dated

November 5, 2013 and August 12, 2014 as amended appointing

Schonfeld Inc. Manager, as detailed in the attached timedockets
Our fee: $ 28,920.00
HST @ 13% 3.759.60
Our fee $ 32,679.60

disbursements: Briarlane Management Fee for
maintaining books for Sch B and C

properties - incl HST 5,650.00
T2 filing fees - incl HST 1,559.33
courier charges incl HST 132.97
Total Fees and Disbursements | $ _40,021.90 |
S. Harlan Schonfeld CPA, CIRP 2.0 $600 $ 1,200.00
James Merryweather, CPA, CGA 60.0 $450 $ 27,000.00
Stephanie Williams 4.8 $150 3 720.00
TOTAL: 66.8 $ 28920.00

H.S.T. #87283 8339 RT0001

Tel. 416.862.7785 Fax. 416.862-2136
info@schonfeldinc.com
77 King Street West, Suite 3000, P O Box 95, Toronto, Ontario @
MS3K 1G8
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Timedocket S Harlan Schonfeld CPA, CIRP
ENGAGEMENT NAME: Dr. Bernstein v Walton
Date: September 20, 2013
TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)
S. HARLAN SCHONFELD, CPA, CA CIRP
12-Jan-17 prepare for and attend conf call w/Goodmans &
Merryweather 1.5
24-Jan-17 attend at Goodmans to sign Stat Dec re Queens Corner -
Tarion, and give instructions to collect cost award from
Kartelle 0.5
|TOTAL 2.0|

HARLAN SCHONFELD




Timedocket James Merryweather
ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON
Insolvency Date:

TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)

JAMES MERRYWEATHER, CPA, CGA
03-Jan-17 review banking, update cashflow; update projections;

review proofs of claim and supporting documents, corr w

creditors re deficiencies. issue notices of disallowance 4.0
04-Jan-17 tc w CRA; prepare documents for HST audit, courier same 1.5
05-Jan-17 prepare year-end accounting and adjustments for Schedule

C companies; review docusments for tax audit 2.0
06-Jan-17 prepare documents for Fraser Properties GST appeal, send

same to CRA 1.0
09-Jan-17 review banking, update cashflow; prepare tax doxuments

for inquiry; review claim correspondence 5.0
10-Jan-17 prepare fee allocation analysis; corr w City re realty tax

rebate; corr w counsel 3.5
11-Jan-17 process AP; prepare fee allocation analysis; 4.0
12-Jan-17 conf call w HS, counsel; prepare fee allocation analysis;

prepare interest income analysis; prepare tax documents for

inauirv 4.0
13-Jan-17 finalize financials and file T2s (2014) for various Sch C

companies 4.5
16-Jan-17 review banking, update cashflow; dealing w GIC

reinvestments; prepare tax documents; prepare and file T2 4.5
17-Jan-17 prepare tax documents; prepare year-end accounting and

analysis 3.5
18-Jan-17 review proof of claim support, document same, corr w

creditors; prepare and file T2; prepare tax documents 4.0
19-Jan-17 prepare T2 1.0
20-Jan-17 prepare T2s; review proof of claim support docs, update

database; prepare Y/E accounting; tc w CRA; tc w counsel 3.0
23-Jan-17 review banking, update cashflow; prepare T2; review proof

of claim support documents, update claims database;

porepare tax documents 4.0
24-Jan-17 prepare tax documents; working w BL re year-end

accounting and reports 3.5
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Timedocket

James Merryweather

ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON

Insolvency Date:

25-Jan-17 prepare year-end accounting and analysis; prepare tax
documents; prepare schedule for Court report; dealing w
creditor issue 5.0
26-Jan-17 prepare year-end accounting and analysis; prepare tax
documents 2.0
|ToTAL JAMES MERRYWEATHER 60.0]
Disbursements
Expense GST/HST Total
Courier to CRA (T2-Sch C) S 1439 S 1.87 S 16.26
Courier to CRA (Cityview) $ 1439 S 1.87 $ 16.26
Courier to CRA (Fraser Properties) $ 1640 $ 082 $ 17.22
Courier to Briarlane S 382 S 497 $  43.23
$ -
S 83.44 S 9.53 § 92.97
0 - T2 filings - 2012 @ 199.99 $ - % -~ B .
0 - T2 filings - 2013 @ 199.99 % - B s § =
5 -T2 filings - 2014 @ 229.99 $1,149.95 $ 14949 §$ 1,299.44
1 - T2 filings - 2015 @ 229.99 S 22999 S 2990 S 259.89
$1,379.94 S 179.39 $ 1,559.33
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Timedocket Stephanie Williams 315
ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON
Insolvency Date:

TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)

STEPHANIE WILLIAMS
03-Jan-17 Emails and telephone calls to and from creditors as per J. Merryweather's

instructions. 0.5
06-Jan-17 Emails to and from creditors as per J. Merryweather's instructions. 0.5
09-Jan-17 Emails to and from creditors as per J. Merryweather's instructions. 0.5
11-Jan-17 Emails and telephone calls with a creditor as per J. Merryweather's

instructions. 1.0
17-Jan-17 Telephone call with creditor and follow-up email to J. Merryweather. 0.5
18-Jan-17 Emails to and from creditors as per J. Merryweather's instructions. 1.5
20-Jan-17 Emails to creditors as per J. Merryweather's instruction. 0.3

|TOTAL STEPHANIE WILLIAMS 4.8|
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Briarlane Rental Property Management Inc. I nvo i ce
85 Spy Court
Suite 100 Date Invoice #
Markham, Ontario 1312017 24487
L3R 474
Invoice To
Schonfeld Inc
77 King St. West, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 95
TD Centre North Tower
Toronto, ON M5K 1G8
P.O. No. Terms Project
Description Qty Rate Amount
Management Fees for maintening the books for all the Schedule B 5,000.00 5,000.00
and Schedule C properties
HST (ON) on sales 13.00% 650.00
Total $5,650.00
Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due $5.650.00

GST/HST No. 864340849






Schonfeld Inec.

Receivers+Trustees

March 3, 2017

Norma Walton, Ronauld Walton, The Rose &
Thistle Group Ltd. and Eglinton Castle Inc; and
those Corporations listed on Schedule "B" of an
an Order made on November 5, 2013; and those
Properties listed on Schedule "C" of an Order
made on August 12, 2014

30 Hazelton Avenue

Toronto, ON M5R 2E2

*INVOICE*
Re: Court Appointed Manager's account

To: Professional services rendered for the period January 27, 2017
to February 28, 2017 under the terms of an Order dated
November 5, 2013 and August 12, 2014 as amended appointing
Schonfeld Inc. Manager, as detailed in the attached timedockets

Our fee:

HST @ 13%

QOur fee

disbursements: Briarlane Management Fee for
maintaining books for Sch B and C
properties - incl HST
travel expenses - incl HST
T2 filing fees - incl HST
courier charges incl HST

Total Fees and Disbursements

Invoice #1070

$ 25,320.00
3,291.60

$ 28611.60

7,259.69
766.98
2,339.00
179.79

|$ 39,157.06 |

S. Harlan Schonfeld CPA, CIRP - $600 $ -

James Merryweather, CPA, CGA 54.5 $450 $ 24,525.00
Stephanie Williams 5.3 $150 $ 795.00
TOTAL: 59.8 $__25.320.00

H.S.T. #87283 8339 RT0001

Tel. 416.862.7785 Fax, 416.862-2136
g info@schonfeld inc.com

77 King Street West, Suite 3000 P O Box 95, Toronto, Ontario

MSK 1G8




Timedocket James Merryweather
ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON
Insolvency Date:

318

TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)

JAMES MERRYWEATHER, CPA, CGA
30-Jan-17 review banking, update cashflow; dealing w Tarion

proceeds; file T2s (Sch C); prepar and file GST (Sch B);

prepare tax anbeal 5.5
31-Jan-17 prepare and file GST (Sch B and Sch C); prepare tax

documents; dealing w Tarion refund 3.5
01-Feb-17 prepare T2s (Sch C) and tax schedules; prepare tax

documents 3.5
02-Feb-17 prepare T2s (Sch C) and tax schedules; prepare tax

documents 4.0
06-Feb-17 review banking, update cashflow; process AP; prepare T2s

(Sch C) and schedules; tc w CRA re GST claim 4.5
09-Feb-17 prepare fee allocation schedule for Court report; tc w CRA;

prepare docs for GST audit 4.5
10-Feb-17 review tax documents, prepare deposit 1.0
13-Feb-17 review banking, update cashflow; attend at Meridian; tc w

counsel, prepare info for report; prepare tax schedules 4.0
15-Feb-17 prepare and file tax appeal; final distribution re Donalda;

process AP; prepare and file GST returns; prepare year-end

accounting and tax schedules; dealing w claim issue; corr w

cotingel 6.0
16-Feb-17 prepare year-wns accounting and tax schedules 2.5
17-Feb-17 prepare notice of disallowance; corr w creditor 0.5
20-Feb-17 review banking, update cashflow; prepare and file T2s (Sch

Q) 2.0
21-Feb-17 prepare T2s (Sch C); tc w CRA; prepare documents for GST

audit; prepare vear-end accounting; prepare tax schedules 4.5
22-Feb-17 prepare and file T2s (Sch C); prepare distribution re 6195

claim process; prepare GST for deposit; tc w CRA 3.5
24-Feb-17 prepare tax information for Court report; prepare T2

amendment 1.0
27-Feb-17 review banking, update cashflow; GIC investing; prepare

year-end analysis and accounting (Sch B); tc w CRA,; file

amended schedules 3.5



Timedocket James Merryweather
ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON
Insolvency Date:

319

28-Feb-17 prepare tax information for Court report 0.5
|ToTAL JAMES MERRYWEATHER 54.5]
Disbursements
Expense GST/HST Total
Courier to CRA S 1425 S 214 S 16.39
Courier to CRA (BHH GST) S 1499 S 195 $ 16.94
Courier to CRA-2 (UEL, 30A) and Briarlane S 4890 $ 6.74 $ 5564
Courier to CRA-2 (6195, CAR) and Meridian $ 4497 $ 585 $  50.82
Airfare $ 42225 $  62.84 $ 485.09
Hotel $ 25030 $§ 3159 $ 281.89
§ 79566 $ 111.11 $ 906.77
0 - T2 filings - 2012 @ 199.99 S -8 = & -
0 - T2 filings - 2013 @ 199.99 $ - 8 = 8 -
5 -T2 filings - 2014 @ 229.99 $1,149.95 $ 14950 $ 1,299.45
4 -T2 filings - 2015 @ 229.99 $ 919.96 $ 119.59 $ 1,039.55
$2,06991 $ 269.09 $ 2,339.00



Timedocket

Stephanie Williams

ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON

Insolvency Date:

TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)

STEPHANIE WILLIAMS
23-Jan-17 Emails and telephone calls with creditors as per J. Merryweather's

instructions. 2.0
24-Jan-17 Emails to creditors as per J. Merryweather's instructions. 0.5
26-Jan-17 Emails to creditors as per J. Merryweather's instructions. 0.5
06-Feb-17 Receiving and responding to creditor communications as per J.

Merryweather's instructions. 0.5
08-Feb-17 Receiving and responding to creditor communications as per J.

Merryweather's instructions. 0.5
09-Feb-17 Receiving and responding to creditor communications as per J.

Merryweather's instructions. 0.5
17-Feb-17 Reviewing notice of disallowance and dispute notice, and sending them

as per J. Merryweather's instructions. Email exchange with J.

Merrvweather. 0.5
24-Feb-17 Emails to and from creditors as per J. Merryweather's instructions. 0.3

|ToTAL STEPHANIE WILLIAMS 5.3]
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Briarlane Rental Property Management Inc. l nvo i ce
85 Spy Court
Suite 100 Date Invoice #
Markham, Ontario 2/28/2017 24777
L3R 474
Invoice To
Schonfeld Inc
77 King St. West, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 95
TD Centre North Tower
Toronto, ON M5K 1G8
P.0O. No. Terms Project
Description Qty Rate Amount
Management Fees for maintening the books for all the Schedule B 5,000.00 5,000.00
and Schedule C properties
Reimbursement of Rasha's hours Dec 13, 14 & 15 2016 255 24.00 612.00
Reimbursement of Rasha's hours Dec 20 & 21 2016 2.5 24.00 300.00
Reimbursement of Rasha's hours Jan 24, 25, 26 2017 21 24.00 504.00
Reimbursement of Rasha's hours Feb 17, 2017 8.50 8.50
HST (ON) on sales 13.00% 835.19
Total $7,259.69
Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due $7.259.60

GST/HST No. 864340849






Schonfeld Inc.

Receivers+Trustees

April 4, 2017

Norma Walton, Ronauld Walton, The Rose &
Thistle Group Ltd. and Eglinton Castle Inc; and
those Corporations listed on Schedule "B" of an
an Order made on November 5, 2013; and those
Properties listed on Schedule "C" of an Order
made on August 12, 2014

30 Hazelton Avenue

Toronto, ON M5R 2E2

Invoice #1075
*INVOICE*

Re: Court Appointed Manager's account
To: Professional services rendered for the period March 1, 2017

to March 31, 2017 under the terms of an Order dated

November 5, 2013 and August 12, 2014 as amended appointing

Schonfeld Inc. Manager, as detailed in the attached timedockets
Our fee: $ 26,940.00
HST @ 13% 3.5602.20

R G

Our fee $ 30,442.20

disbursements: Briarlane Management Fee for
maintaining books for Sch B and C

properties - incl HST 5,870.92

T2 filing fees - incl HST 4.678.00

courier charges incl HST 40.00
Total Fees and Disbursements {$ 41,031.12]

S. Harlan Schonfeld CPA, CIRP 1.0 $600 $ 600.00
James Merryweather, CPA, CGA 57.5 $450 $ 25,875.00
Stephanie Williams 3.1 $150 3 465.00
TOTAL: 61.6 $_26,940.00

H.S.T. #87283 8339 RT0001

Tel. 416.862.7785 Fax. 416.862-2136
info@schonfeldinc.com
77 King Street West, Suite 3000, P O Box 95, Toronto, Ontario 288
MS5K 1G8




Timedocket

S Harlan Schonfeld CPA, CIRP

ENGAGEMENT NAME: Dr. Bernstein v Walton
Date: September 20, 2013
TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)
S. HARLAN SCHONFELD, CPA, CA CIRP
Mar21-17 attend at Goodmans to review, finalize and sign 47th
Manager's Report 1.0

|T7)TAL HARLAN SCHONFELD 1.0|
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Timedocket

ENGAGEMENT NAME
Insolvency Date:

James Merryweather
DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON

TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)

JAMES MERRYWEATHER, CPA, CGA
01-Mar-17 prepare and file GST returns (Jan/Feb); tc w CRA re T2 issue;

dealing w GICs re fee allocation and claims process 2.5
02-Mar-17 prepare year-end accounting analysis and adjusting entries 3.5
06-Mar-17 review banking, update cashflow; funding and fee analysis;

prepare year-end accounting analysis and adjustments;

review GST issues: 4.0
08-Mar-17 prepare and file T2s (Sch C); prepare tax analysis and

schedules 3.5
09-Mar-17 prepare and file T2 (Sch C) 1.0
10-Mar-17 prepare and file T2s (Sch C); tc w CRA re GST issue 1.5
13-Mar-17 review banking, update cashflow; prepare and file T2s (Sch

C); prepare draft T2s (Sch B); dealing w GIC reinvestments 4.5
14-Mar-17 prepare draft T2s (Sch B); tc w CRA re GST issue, prepare

docs re same 4.0
15-Mar-17 prepare schedule for Court report; prepare and file T2 (Sch

B) 15
16-Mar-17 PREPARE DRAFT T2s (Sch B) and accounting entries 25
17-Mar-17 review draft Court report, provide information; review tax

issues 1.0
20-Mar-17 review banking, update cashflow; tc w CRA re GST issue;

prepare accounting 1.0
21-Mar-17 review draft Court report, provide comments; prepare and

file T2s (Sch C); prepare v/e entries 3.0
22-Mar-17 prepare draft T2s (Sch B); prepare y/e accounting 3.0
23-Mar-17 prepare draft T2s (Sch B); prepare y/e accounting 5.0
27-Mar-17 review banking, update cashflow; dealing w GIC investing;

prepare claims distribution analysis; 3.5
28-Mar-17 prepare draft T2s (Sch B); prepare accounting adjustments;

GST analysis; banking issues 4.0
29-Mar-17 prepare and file T2s (Sch B); prepar accounting analysis and

adjustments 3.5
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Timedocket

James Merryweather

ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON

Insolvency Date:

30-Mar-17 prepare and file T2s (Sch C); prepare GIC accounting; dealing
w GST issue 3.5
31-Mar-17 prepare proposed distribution, corr w creditors; update
claims database 15
|TOTAL JAMES MERRYWEATHER 57-5]
Disbursements
Expense GST/HST Total
3 5
$ -
S - 8 - 8 -
0 -T2 filings - 2012 @ 199.99 5 = 8 = 8 -
0 - T2 filings - 2013 @ 199.99 $ - B - @ -
5 -T2 filings - 2014 @ 229.99 $1,149.95 $§ 14949 S 1,299.44
9 -T2 filings - 2015 @ 229.99 $2,069.91 $ 269.10 $ 2,339.01
4 -T2 filings - 2016 @ 229.99 $ 919.96 $ 119.59 $ 1,039.55
$4,139.82 $§ 538.18 $ 4,678.00
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Timedocket Stephanie Williams 326
ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON
Insolvency Date:

TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)

STEPHANIE WILLIAMS
09-Mar-17 Responding to creditor emails as per J. Merryweather's instructions. 0.5
10-Mar-17 Responding to creditor emails as per J. Merryweather's request. 0.3
13-Mar-17 Reaching out to CRA as per J. Merryweather's request and follow-up

emails with J. Merryweather. 0.5
23-Mar-17 Telephone call with R. Ready of CRA. 0.5
27-Mar-17 Telephone call with CRA as per J. Merryweather's instructions and follow-

up reporting email to J. Merryweather. 0.5
31-Mar-17 Preparing notice email for creditors as per J. Merryweather's

instructions. 0.8

[ToTAL STEPHANIE WILLIAMS 3.1|
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Briarlane Rental Property Management Inc. | nvo i ce

85 Spy Court
Suite 100 Date Invoice #

Markham, Ontario 3/31/2017 24968
L3R 474

Invoice To

Schonfeld Inc

77 King St. West, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 95
TD Centre North Tower

Toronto, ON M5K 1G8

P.O. No. Terms Project
Description Qty Rate Amount
Management Fees for maintening the books for all the Schedule B 5,000.00 5,000.00
and Schedule C properties - March 2017
Reimbursement of Rasha's hours Feb 17 2017 8.5 24.00 204.00
For Feb 17 2017, on Inv2477, in error we only charged $8.50 -8.50 -8.50
instead of $204- Difference being charged now. Copy of Inv.
Attached
HST (ON) on sales 13.00% 675.42
Total $5,870.92
Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due $5.870.92

GST/HST No. 864340849






Schonfeld Inc.

Receivers+Trustees

May 2, 2017

Norma Walton, Ronauld Walton, The Rose &
Thistle Group Ltd. and Eglinton Castle Inc; and
those Corporations listed on Schedule "B" of an
an Order made on November 5, 2013; and those
Properties listed on Schedule "C" of an Order
made on August 12, 2014

30 Hazelton Avenue

Toronto, ON M5R 2E2

Invoice #1080
*INVOICE*
Re: Court Appointed Manager's account
To: Professional services rendered for the period April 1, 2017
to April 30, 2017 under the terms of an Order dated
November 5, 2013 and August 12, 2014 as amended appointing
Schonfeld Inc. Manager, as detailed in the attached timedockets
Our fee: $ 17,295.00
HST @ 13% 2.248 35
Our fee $ 19,543.35
disbursements: Briarlane Management Fee for
maintaining books for Sch B and C
properties - incl HST 5,880.52
T2 filing fees - incl HST 259.89
courier charges incl HST 73.10
Total Fees and Disbursements |$ 25,756.86 |

S. Harlan Schonfeld CPA, CIRP - $600 $ -

James Merryweather, CPA, CGA 37.0 $450 $ 16,650.00
Stephanie Williams 4.3 $150 $ 645.00
TOTAL: 41.3 $ 17.295.00

H.S.T. #87283 8339 RT0001

Tel. 416.862.7785 Fax. 416.862-2136
info@schonfeldinc.com
77 King Street West, Suite 3000, P O Box 95, Toronto, Ontario ~ ~fe
MS5K 1G8




Timedocket James Merryweather 329
ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON
Insolvency Date:

TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)
JAMES MERRYWEATHER, CPA, CGA
03-Apr-17 review banking, update cashflow; dealing w GIC
investments; prepare year-end accounting; dealing w
Weston morteagee issue: 3.5
05-Apr-17 prepare draft T2s (Sch C); prepar accounting entries; dealing
w GST banking issue 3.0
07-Apr-17 prepare and file Q3/Mar. GST returns (Sch B and C); prepare
draft T2s (Sch C) and adijusting entries 5.0
10-Apr-17 review banking, update cashflow; prepare for claims process
funding 1.0
12-Apr-17 implement April 12 Order, including cheque preparation,
record keeping, fee allocation, accounting and tax issues,
GIC activitv 5.5
13-Apr-17 prepare draft T2 (Sch C); dealing w April 12 Order re fees;
prepare accounting; prepar distribution letters 2.0
17-Apr-17 review banking, update cashflow; GIC redemptions and
accounting; finalize financials; tc w counsel re GST issue 3.0
18-Apr-17 dealing w GIC maturities and accounting; prepare cheques
and letters for claims distribution; tc w CRA re GST issue; 4.5
21-Apr-17 attend at Meridian; prepare accounting analysis; dealing w
GIC, fee reimbursement; prepare docs for GST audit; 3.0
24-Apr-17 review banking, update cashflow; dealing w GIC maturities;
corr w CRA re GST issue; prepare GST analysis for filing; set
up direct deposit (Sch C); prepare and release distributions
re claimeg nrocess 3.5
28-Apr-17 update cashflow; dealing w tax issues; prepare and file T2
(Sch B); respond to Ministry tax inquiries 3.0
[ToTAL JAMES MERRYWEATHER 37.0]
Disbursements
Expense GST/HST Total
Courier to Briarlane S 1465 S 190 $ 16.55
Courier to CRA S 1465 S 190 $ 16.55
S 29.30 S 3.80 S 33.10
1 -T2 filings - 2015 @ 229.99 $ 22999 $ 29.90 $ 259.89
0 - T2 filings - 2016 @ 229.99 $ = B = & .
S 22999 § 29.90 S 259.89



Timedocket

Stephanie Williams

ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON

Insolvency Date:

TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)
STEPHANIE WILLIAMS
03-Apr-17 Emails to and from creditors as per J. Merryweather's instructions. 0.8
04-Apr-17 Telephone call with creditor and follow-up email exchange with J.
Merryweather. 0.5
06-Apr-17 Receiving calls from creditors and email to J. Merryweather regarding
same. 0.5
07-Apr-17 Follow-up email to creditor as per J. Merryweather's instructions. 0.3
11-Apr-17 Telephone call with creditor as per J. Merryweather's instructions. 0.5
12-Apr-17 Email to and from creditors as per J. Merryweather's instructions. 03
17-Apr-17 Responding to creditor emails as per J. Merryweather's instructions. 0.3
18-Apr-17 Telephone call with creditor as per J. Merryweather's instruction. 0.3
19-Apr-17 Emails to and from creditors as per J. Merryweather's instruction. 0.5
21-Apr-17 Emails from creditor and email to J. Merryweather. 0.3
{ToTAL STEPHANIE WILLIAMS 4.3)
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Briarlane Rental Property Management Inc. | nvo i ce
85 Spy Court .
Suite 100 Date Invoice #
Markham, Ontario 4/30/2017 25137
L3R 474

Invoice To

Schonfeld Inc

77 King St. West, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 95
TD Centre North Tower

Toronto, ON M5K 1G8

P.O. No. Terms Project

Description Qty Rate Amount
Management Fees for maintaining the books for all the Schedule B 5,000.00 5,000.00

and Schedule C properties - April 2017

Reimbursement of Rasha's hours Apr 17 2017 8.5 24.00 204.00
HST (ON) on sales 13.00% 676.52
Total $5,880.52
Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due $5,880.52

GST/HST No. 864340849






Schonfeld Inc.

Receivers+Trustees

June 1, 2017

Norma Walton, Ronauld Walton, The Rose &
Thistle Group Ltd. and Eglinton Castle Inc; and
those Corporations listed on Schedule "B" of an
an Order made on November 5, 2013; and those
Properties listed on Schedule "C" of an Order
made on August 12, 2014

30 Hazelton Avenue

Toronto, ON M5R 2E2

Invoice #1085
*INVOICE*
Re: Court Appointed Manager's account
To: Professional services rendered for the period May 1, 2017
to May 31, 2017 under the terms of an Order dated
November 5, 2013 and August 12, 2014 as amended appointing
Schonfeld Inc. Manager, as detailed in the attached timedockets
Our fee: $ 25,425.00
HST @ 13% 3.305.25
Our fee $ 28,730.25
disbursements: Briarlane Management Fee for
maintaining books for Sch B and C
properties - incl HST 5,650.00
T2 filing fees - incl HST 5,717.58
courier charges incl HST 93.91
Total Fees and Disbursements |$ 40,191.74 |

S. Harlan Schonfeld CPA, CIRP - $600 $ -
James Merryweather, CPA, CGA 56.5 $450 $ 25,425.00
Stephanie Williams - $150 $ -
TOTAL: 56.5 $ 25.425.00

H.S.T. #87283 8339 RT0001

Tel. 416.862.7785 Fax. 416.862-2136
) info@schonfeldinc.com <8
77 King Street West, Suite 3000, P O Box 95, Toronto, Ontario
MS5K 1G8




Timedocket James Merryweather
ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON
Insolvency Date:

TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)

JAMES MERRYWEATHER, CPA, CGA
01-May-17 review banking, update cashflow; prepare monthly

accounting 1.5
02-May-17 prepare docs for GST audit; review claims payments 0.5
03-May-17 prepare and send GST audit letter and documents 0.5
08-May-17 review banking, update cashflow; dealing w GIC maturities

and fee reimbursements; review and finalize financials and

orepare analvsis 5.5
09-May-17 review and finalize financials; prepare instructions for GIC

maturities 15
16-May-17 review banking, update cashflow; prepare accounting

entries; prepare financial analysis; tc w CRA 3.0
17-May-17 review and finalize financials; prepare adjustments 3.5
18-May-17 finalize and file T2s (Sch B); prepare and file GST returns;

prepare detailed accounting analysis 4.5
19-May-17 finalize and file T2s (Sch B); prepare and file GST returns;

prepare detailed accounting analysis 3.5
23-May-17 review banking, update cashflow; dealing w GIC

reinvestments; prepare detailed accounting analysis;

prepare and file T2s (Sch B): dealing w GST audit 5.0
24-May-17 prepare detailed accounting analysis; prepare and file T2s

(Sch B); prepare and file GST return 4.5
25-May-17 prepare detailed accounting analysis; prepare and file T2s

(Sch B) 4.5
26-May-17 prepare detailed accounting analysis; prepare and file T2s

(Sch B); prepare and file GST returns 4.5
29-May-17 review banking, update cashflow; GIC accounting; prepare

detailed accounting analysis; prepare and file T2s (Sch B);

prepare and file GST returns: corr w mortgagee 4.5
30-May-17 prepare detailed accounting analysis; prepare and file T2s

(Sch B); prepare and file GST returns; corr re amalgamated

companies: 5.0
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Timedocket

James Merryweather

ENGAGEMENT NAME  DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON

Insolvency Date:

334

31-May-17 prepare detailed accounting analysis; prepare and file T2s
(Sch B); prepare and file GST returns; prepare schedules and
corr re amalgamated comboanies: 4.5
{TOoTAL JAMES MERRYWEATHER 56.5|
Disbursements
Expense GST/HST Total
Courier - CRA S 1136 S 170 S 13.06
Courier - Briarlane S 2451 S 3.28 § 27.79
Courier - CRA S 1136 S 1.70 S 13.06
S 4723 S 6.68 S 53.91
0 - T2 filings - 2015 @ 229.99 S - S -5 -
22 -T2 filings - 2016 @ 229.99 $5,059.78 S 657.80 $ 5,717.58
$5,059.78 S 657.80 S 5,717.58



: 335
Briarlane Rental Property Management Inc.

85 Spy Court
Suite 100 Date Invoice #
Markham, Ontario 5/30/2017 25293
L3R 474
Invoice To
Schonfeld Inc
77 King St. West, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 95
TD Centre North Tower
Toronto, ON M5K 1G8
P.O. No. Terms Project
Description Qty Rate Amount
Management Fees for maintaining the books for all the Schedule B 5,000.00 5,000.00
and Schedule C properties - May 2017
HST (ON) on sales 13.00% 650.00
Total $5,650.00
Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due $5.650.00

GST/HST No. 864340849






Schonfeld Inec.

Receivers+Trustees

July 4, 2017

Norma Walton, Ronauld Walton, The Rose &
Thistle Group Ltd. and Eglinton Castle Inc; and
those Corporations listed on Schedule "B" of an
an Order made on November 5, 2013; and those
Properties listed on Schedule "C" of an Order
made on August 12, 2014

30 Hazelton Avenue

Toronto, ON M5R 2E2

*INVOICE*
Re: Court Appointed Manager's account

To: Professional services rendered for the period June 1, 2017
to June 30, 2017 under the terms of an Order dated
November 5, 2013 and August 12, 2014 as amended appointing
Schonfeld Inc. Manager, as detailed in the attached timedockets

Our fee:

HST @ 13%

- Our fee

disbursements: Briarlane Management Fee for
maintaining books for Sch Band C
properties - incl HST
T2 filing fees - incl HST
courier charges incl HST

Total Fees and Disbursements

Invoice #1090

$ 17,775.00
2.310.75

$ 20,085.75

5,650.00
2,698.92
40.00

I|$ 28,374.67 |

S. Harlan Schonfeld CPA, CIRP 3.0 $600 $ 1,800.00
James Merryweather, CPA, CGA 35.5 $450 $ 15,975.00
Stephanie Williams - $150 $ -

TOTAL: 38.5 $ 17,775.00

H.S.T. #87283 8339 RT0001

Tel. 416.862.7785 Fax. 416.862-2136

info@schonfeldinc.
- info@schonfeldinc.com

MSK 1G8

77 King Street West, Suite 3000, P O Box 95, Toronto, Ontario




Timedocket S Harlan Schonfeld CPA, CIRP

ENGAGEMENT NAME: Dr. Bernstein v Walton
Date: September 20, 2013
TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)

S. HARLAN SCHONFELD, CPA, CA CIRP

13-Jun-17 review draft 48th Court report and comment 0.5

14-Jun-17 review amended report 0.5

19-Jun-17 attend Court motion re: Handelman; deal w/settlement 2.0
[TOTAL HARLAN SCHONFELD 3.0]
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Timedocket James Merryweather 338
ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON
Insolvency Date:

TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)
JAMES MERRYWEATHER, CPA, CGA
01-Jun-17 prepare detailed accounting analysis; prepare and file T2s
(Sch B); prepare and file GST returns 3.0
05-Jun-17 review banking, update cashflow; review amended financials
(Sch C); prepare and file GST Return (Sch C); monthly
accounting; dealing w assumed company accounting issues
3.5
06-Jun-17 prepare and file T2s (Sch C); prepare tax docs; dealing w
assumed company accounting issues; prepare detailed
accounting analvsis 6.5
07-Jun-17 prepare and file T2s (Sch C); prepare tax docs; prepare
detailed accounting analysis 2.5
08-Jun-17 prepare and file T2s (Sch C); prepare tax docs; prepare
detailed accounting analysis 2.0
09-Jun-17 prepare financial analysis (LVP) and amend draft T2; update
GIC accounting 1.0
12-Jun-17 review banking, update cashflow; prepare and file T2s (Sch
C); prepare detailed accounting analysis; prepare fee and
expense allocation 5.0
13-Jun-17 review legal materials filed by Wallach; review draft Court
report, provide schedule; review amended report 2.5
14-Jun-17 prepare and file T2s (Sch C); prepare detailed acounting
analysis; review amended report, sign and return same 2.5
19-Jun-17 review banking, update cashflow; various tc re Court
appearance; dealing w GIC maturity; process AP; prepare tax
documents 2.0
28-Jun-17 review banking, update cashflow; update accounting 0.5
30-Jun-17 prepare and file GST returns (Sch B and C) - May/Jun and Q2;
prepare month-end accounting; GIC renewals; corr w
Enbridee re claim 4.5
ITOTAL JAMES MERRYWEATHER 35.5|
Disbursements
Expense GST/HST Total
10 - T2 filings - 2016 @ 229.99 $2,299.90 $ 299.02 $ 2,598.92

$2,299.90 S 299.02 S 2,598.92
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Briarlane Rental Property Management Inc. I nvo i ce
85 Spy Court
Suite 100 Date Invoice #
Markham, Ontario 6/30/2017 25488
L3R 474
Invoice To
Schonfeld Inc
77 King St. West, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 95
TD Centre North Tower
Toronto, ON M5K 1G8
P.O. No. Terms Project
Description Qty Rate Amount
Management Fees for maintaining the books for all the Schedule B 5,000.00 5,000.00
and Schedule C properties - June 2017
HST (ON) on sales 13.00% 650.00
Total $5,650.00
Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due $5.650.00

GST/HST No. 864340849






Schonfeld Inec.

Receivers+Trustees

August 2, 2017

Norma Walton, Ronauld Walton, The Rose &
Thistle Group Ltd. and Eglinton Castle Inc; and
those Corporations listed on Schedule "B" of an
an Order made on November 5, 2013; and those
Properties listed on Schedule "C" of an Order
made on August 12, 2014

30 Hazelton Avenue

Toronto, ON M5R 2E2

Invoice #1095
*INVOICE*
Re: Court Appointed Manager's account
To: Professional services rendered for the period July 1, 2017
to July 31, 2017 under the terms of an Order dated
November 5, 2013 and August 12, 2014 as amended appointing
Schonfeld Inc. Manager, as detailed in the attached timedockets
Our fee: ‘ $ 11,325.00
HST @ 13% 1.472.25
Our fee $ 12,797.25

disbursements: Briarlane Management Fee for
maintaining books for Sch B and C

properties - incl HST 5,650.00

T2 filing fees - incl HST 519.78

courier charges incl HST 32.96
Total Fees and Disbursements I$ 18,999.99 |

S. Harlan Schonfeld CPA, CIRP 1.0 $600 $ 600.00
James Merryweather, CPA, CGA 235 $450 $ 10,575.00
Stephanie Williams 1.0 $150 $ 150.00
TOTAL: 255 $_11.325.00

H.S.T. #87283 8339 RT0001

Tel. 416.862.7785 Fax. 416.862-2136
info@schonfeldinc.com
i 77 King Street West, Suite 3000, P O Box 95, Toronto, Ontario L
M5K 1G8




Timedocket S Harlan Schonfeld CPA, CIRP

341

ENGAGEMENT NAME: Dr. Bernstein v Walton
Date: September 20, 2013
TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)
S. HARLAN SCHONFELD, CPA, CA CIRP
25-Jul-17 banking and cash receipts; 1.0
{TOTAL HARLAN SCHONFELD 1.0}




Timedocket

James Merryweather

ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON

Insolvency Date:

342

TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)
JAMES MERRYWEATHER, CPA, CGA
04-Jul-17 review banking, update cashflow; update fee allocation;
prepare and file T2 (Sch B); detailed accounting analysis 3.0
06-Jul-17 tc and corr w Meridian re GICs; conf call w counsel re
distributions, legal issues; review Orders and schedules; corr
w mortgagee 1.0
07-Jul-17 prepare analysis of surplus funds and potential distributions;
update GIC accounting; review legal issues 3.0
10-Jul-17 review banking, update cashflow; GIC accounting; prepare
and file T2 (Sch B); detailed accounting analysis 3.5
11-Jul-17 tc e counsel re potential distribution, analysis; review
investment analysis 0.5
14-Jul-17 prepare tax documents for request; tc w CRA; prepare docs
for GST audit 3.5
17-Jul-17 review banking, update cashflow; accounting for GST
refunds; fee allocation transfers 1.0
21-Jul-17 transfer funds re fee allocation; investing GICs and
accounting for same' tc w CRA (2); prepare tax analysis, send
to CRA re audit 2.0
24-Jul-17 review banking, update cashflow; GIC investing and
accounting; detailed tax analysis 3.5
27-Jul-17 tc w counsel re claims process, tax issues, Court report 0.5
28-Jul-17 dealing w GIC investments and accounting; prepare sales
analysis; fee allocation transfers 2.0
[ToTAL JAMES MERRYWEATHER 23.5]
Disbursements
Expense GST/HST Total
Courier to CRA $ 1458 § 190 $ 16.48
Courier to CRA $ 1458 $ 1.90 $ 1648
S 29.16 §$ 3.80 S 32.96
Expense GST/HST Total
2 -T2 filings - 2016 @ 229.99 $ 45998 $§ 59.80 $ 519.78
S 459.98 § 5080 S 519.78



Timedocket Stephanie Williams
ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON
Insolvency Date:

TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)

STEPHANIE WILLIAMS
26-Jul-17 Emails and telephone calls with creditor as per J. Merryweather's

instructions. 0.5
28-Jul-17 Fielding voicemail, transcribing and communicating it to both J.

Merryweather and R. Link (as per J. Merryweather's instructions). 0.5

|{ToTAL STEPHANIE WILLIAMS 1.0}

343



344
Briarlane Rental Property Management Inc.

85 Spy Court
Suite 100 Date Invoice #
Markham, Ontario 7/31/2017 25690
L3R 474
Invoice To
Schonfeld Inc
77 King St. West, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 95
TD Centre North Tower
Toronto, ON M5K 1G8
P.O. No. Terms Project
Description Qty Rate Amount
Management Fees for maintaining the books for all the Schedule B 5,000.00 5,000.00
and Schedule C properties - July 2017
HST (ON) on sales 13.00% 650.00
Total $5,650.00
Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due $5.650.00

GST/HST No. 864340849






Schonfeld Inc.

Heceivers+Trustees

September 5, 2017

Norma Walton, Ronauld Walton, The Rose &
Thistle Group Ltd. and Eglinton Castle Inc; and
those Corporations listed on Schedule "B" of an
an Order made on November 5, 2013; and those
Properties listed on Schedule "C" of an Order
made on August 12, 2014

30 Hazelton Avenue

Toronto, ON M5R 2E2

*INVOICE*
Re: Court Appointed Manager's account

To: Professional services rendered for the period August 1, 2017
to August 31, 2017 under the terms of an Order dated
November 5, 2013 and August 12, 2014 as amended appointing
Schonfeld Inc. Manager, as detailed in the attached timedockets

Our fee:

HST @ 13%

Our fee

disbursements: Briarlane Management Fee for
maintaining books for Sch B and C
properties - incl HST
courier charges incl HST

Total Fees and Disbursements

Invoice #1100
$ 11,040.00
1,435.20
$ 12,475.20
5,650.00
33.67
$ 18,158.87 |

S. Harlan Schonfeld CPA, CIRP 2.0 $600 $ 1,200.00
James Merryweather, CPA, CGA 21.5 $450 $ 9,675.00
Stephanie Williams 1.1 $150 3 165.00
TOTAL: 24.6 $ 11.040.00

H.S.T. #87283 8339 RT0001

Tel. 416.862.7785 Fax. 416.862-2136
info@schonfeldinc.com

# 77 King Street West, Suite 3000, P O Box 95, Toronto, Ontario ¢

MSK 1G8




Timedocket

S Harlan Schonfeld CPA, CIRP

ENGAGEMENT NAME: Dr. Bernstein v Walton
Date: September 20, 2013
TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)

S. HARLAN SCHONFELD, CPA, CA CIRP

Aug 22-17 conf call/Goodmans & Merryweather re: Motion 1.0

Aug 24-17 conf call w/Goodmans & Merryweather re Report and

motion for dischagre 1.0

{TOTAL HARLAN SCHONFELD 2.0]
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Timedocket James Merryweather 347
ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON
Insolvency Date:

TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)
JAMES MERRYWEATHER, CPA, CGA
01-Aug-17 review banking, update cashflow; dealing w GIC investments
and accounting 1.0
03-Aug-17 process AP; dealing w tax and distribution issues 0.5
09-Aug-17 review banking, update cashflow; update fee allocation
analysis 1.0
14-Aug-17 review banking, update cashflow; prepare docs for GST
audit, send to CRA; file GST returns 15
15-Aug-17 prepare accounting and banking (Sch C) 1.0
17-Aug-17 prepare banking and accounting (Sch B); corr w counsel re
Court report; review Sch C financial info 2.5
21-Aug-17 review banking, update cashflow; review Sch C financial info
1.0
22-Aug-17 conf call w counsel; prepare info for report 1.5
23-Aug-17 prepare accounting information; prepare creditor
information 2.0
24-Aug-17 review draft Court report, prepare information; review
funding analysis; tc w CRA; prepare info for GST audit, send
same: conf call w counsel 3.5
25-Aug-17 prepare docs, corr w creditors 0.5
31-Aug-17 review banking, update cashflow; prepare GST analysis re
claims process; update financials for assumed companies;
review Sch B financials 5.5
[ToTAL JAMES MERRYWEATHER 21.5]
Disbursements
Expense GST/HST Total
Courier to CRA S 1631 S 082 $ 17.13
Courier to CRA S 1438 S 216 §  16.54

S 3069 $ 298 S 33.67



Timedocket Stephanie Williams
ENGAGEMENT NAME DR. BERNSTEIN v WALTON
Insolvency Date:

TIME
DATE DESCRIPTION (hh/mm)

STEPHANIE WILLIAMS
25-Aug-17 Preparing distribution and sending letter to creditors as per J.

Merryweather's instructions regarding Weston and Riverdale. 0.5
29-Aug-17 Receiving creditor call and follow-up email to J. Merryweather regarding

same. 0.3
30-Aug-17 Responding to Creditor inquiry as per J. Merryweather's instructions. 0.3

ToTAL STEPHANIE WILLIAMS 1.1]
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Briarlane Rental Property Management Inc. l nvo i ce
85 Spy Court
Suite 100 Date Invoice #
Markham, Ontario 8/31/2017 25828
L3R 474
Invoice To
Schonfeld Inc
77 King St. West, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 95
TD Centre North Tower
Toronto, ON M5K 1G8
P.O. No. Terms Project
Description Qty Rate Amount
Management Fees for maintaining the books for all the Schedule B 5,000.00 5,000.00
and Schedule C properties - Aug 2017
HST (ON) on sales 13.00% 650.00
Total $5,650.00
Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due $5.650.00

GST/HST No. 864340849
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SCHEDULE “A” COMPANIES

Dr. Bernstein Diet Clinics Ltd.
2272551 Ontario Limited

DBDC Investments Atlantic Ltd.
DBDC Investments Pape Ltd.
DBDC Investments Highway 7 Ltd.
DBDC Investments Trent Ltd.
DBDC Investments St. Clair Ltd.
DBDC Investments Tisdale Ltd.
DBDC Investments Leslie Ltd.
DBDC Investments Lesliebrook Ltd.
DBDC Fraser Properties Ltd.

DBDC Fraser Lands Ltd.

DBDC Queen’s Corner Ltd.

DBDC Queen’s Plate Holdings Inc.
DBDC Dupont Developments Ltd.
DBDC Red Door Developments Inc.
DBDC Red Door Lands Inc.

DBDC Global Mills Ltd.

DBDC Donalda Developments Ltd.
DBDC Salmon River Properties Ltd.
DBDC Cityview Lands Ltd.

DBDC Weston Lands Ltd.

DBDC Double Rose Developments Ltd.
DBDC Skyway Holdings Ltd.
DBDC West Mall Holdings Ltd.
DBDC Royal Gate Holdings Ltd.
DBDC Dewhurst Developments Ltd.
DBDC Eddystone Place Ltd.

DBDC Richmond Row Holdings Ltd.
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SCHEDULE “B” COMPANIES
Twin Dragons Corporation

Bannockburn Lands Inc. / Skyline — 1185 Eglinton Avenue Inc.

Wynford Professional Centre Ltd.
Liberty Village Properties Inc.
Liberty Village Lands Inc.
Riverdale Mansion Ltd.

Royal Agincourt Corp.

Hidden Gem Development Inc.
Ascalon Lands Ltd.

Tisdale Mews Inc.

Lesliebrook Holdings Ltd.
Lesliebrook Lands Ltd.

Fraser Properties Corp.

Fraser Lands Ltd.

Queen’s Corner Corp.

Northern Dancer Lands Ltd.
Dupont Developments Ltd.

Red Door Developments Inc. and Red Door Lands Ltd.
Global Mills Inc.

Donalda Developments Ltd.
Salmon River Properties Ltd.
Cityview Industrial Ltd.

Weston Lands Ltd.

Double Rose Developments Ltd.
Skyway Holdings Ltd.

West Mall Holdings Ltd.

Royal Gate Holdings Ltd.
Dewhurst Development Ltd.
Eddystone Place Inc.

Richmond Row Holdings Ltd.
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31. El-Ad Limited
32. 165 Bathurst Inc.
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SCHEDULE “C” PROPERTIES

3270 American Drive, Mississauga, Ontario

0 Luttrell Ave., Toronto, Ontario

2 Kelvin Avenue, Toronto, Ontario

346 Jarvis Street, Suites A, B, C, E and F, Toronto, Ontario
1 William Morgan Drive, Toronto, Ontario

324 Prince Edward Drive, Toronto, Ontario

24 Ceclil Street, Toronto, Ontario

30 and 30A Hazelton Avenue, Toronto, Ontario

777 St. Clarens Avenue, Toronto, Ontario

252 Carlton Street and 478 Parliament Street, Toronto, Ontario
66 Gerrard Street East, Toronto, Ontario

2454 Bayview Avenue, Toronto, Ontario

319-321 Carlaw, Toronto, Ontario

260 Emerson Ave., Toronto, Ontario

44 Park Lane Circle, Toronto, Ontario

19 Tennis Crescent, Toronto, Ontario

646 Broadview, Toronto, Ontario
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DBDC SPADINALTD., etal
Applicants

NORMA WALTON, et al
Respondents
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Court File No. CV-13-10280-00CL

6737998

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
Commercial List

Proceeding commenced at Toronto

AFFIDAVIT OF
S. HARLAN SCHONFELD
(Sworn September 25", 2017)

GOODMANS LLP

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre

333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Canada M5H 2S7

Brian Empey LSUCH#: 30640G
Mark S. Dunn LSUCH#: 55510L
Tel: (416) 979-2211
Fax: (416) 979-1234

Lawyers for The Manager






Court File No.: CV-13-10280-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
COMMERCIAL LIST

BETWEEN:

DBDC SPADINA LTD.,
and THOSE CORPORATIONS LISTED ON SCHEDULE A HERETO

Applicants
and

NORMA WALTON, RONAULD WALTON, THE ROSE & THISTLE GROUP
LTD. and EGLINTON CASTLE INC.

Respondents
and

THOSE CORPORATIONS LISTED ON SCHEDULE B HERETO, TO BE
BOUND BY THE RESULT

AFFIDAVIT OF BRIAN EMPEY
(Sworn September 25, 2017)

I, BRIAN EMPEY, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE OATH
AND SAY:

1. | am a partner with the law firm of Goodmans LLP (“Goodmans”), counsel for
Schonfeld Inc. (the “Manager”) in its capacity as Court-appointed manager of the companies
listed at Schedule “B” to the Order of Justice Newbould dated November 5, 2013 and in its
capacity as Court-appointed receiver/manager of the properties listed at Schedule “C” to the
Judgment and Order of Justice Brown dated August 12, 2014. Since January 31, 2014 (when
Fred Myers was appointed a Judge of the Superior Court), | have been the lawyer at Goodmans
with overall responsibility for this file. As such, | have knowledge of the matters hereinafter

deposed to.

2. Attached hereto and marked as Exhibits “A” — “H” is a copy of each invoice rendered by
Goodmans to the Manager in respect of the period from January 1, 2017 to August 31, 2017 (the
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-3 -

“Goodmans Application Period™). The invoices all reflect a write off for any word processing

and secretarial overtime charges. The invoices have been redacted for confidentiality and/or

privileged information where appropriate.

3. As is shown on the summary chart attached as Exhibit “I”, Goodmans expended a total of
157.9 hours in connection with this matter during the Goodmans Application Period, giving rise

to fees and disbursements totalling $102,848.77, including HST, as outlined in Exhibits “A” —
s

4. Goodmans’ rates and disbursements are consistent with those in the market for these
types of matters. Goodmans has had its rates and disbursements approved by this Honourable
Court previously in this proceeding, most recently by Order of Justice Newbould dated April 12,
2017 and in respect of similar services provided in various insolvency and restructuring files.
SWORN before me at the City of Toronto, M

in the Province of Ontario, on this 25" day
of September, 2017.

(SA >

A Commissioner for taking affidavits
Name: Chris Baxter Y,

Christopher Patrick James Baxter, 8
Commissioner, etc., Province of Ontario,
while a Student-at-Law.

Expires April 14, 2019.
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This is Exhibit “A” referred to in the
affidavit of Brian Empey
sworn before me, this 251

day of September, 2017.

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits

Christopher Patrick James Baxter, a
Commissioner, etc., Province of Ontario,
while a Student-at-Law.

Expires April 14, 2019.
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Barristers & Solicitors

LLP Bay Adelaide Centre
S 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400

Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

February 6, 2017

ATTENTION: S. Harlan Schonfeld

Re: Manager

OUR FILE NO. SFDI 140074

OUR INVOICE NO. 679089
GST/HST REGISTRATION NO. R119422962

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED
MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Date

01/05/17

01/06/17

01/11117

01/11/17

01/16/17
01/17/17

TKID

CEF

GLL

CEF

CEF
CEF

Hours

20

20

.60

1.10

Description

Reviewing correspondence re: Fraser Propesties; e-mailing J. Merryweather
re: same.

875 Queen East: discussions with M. Dunn; receipt and review of City By-
Law and Amendment to Agreement of Purchase and Sale; discussions with K.
Herlin.

Correspondence with clients; preparing motion materials re: security posted to
discharge lien on 30 Hazelton.

Further to exchange of emails with H. Schonfeld review record books in
connection with sale of 875 Queensway property an in particular the mortgage
granted in connection with Red Door Shelter operations at location;
discussions with G. Lauzon re: same following review of files; correct error
by borrower/purchaser that Vendor Take Back mortgage was registered;
exchange emails with H. Schonfeld re: same; discussion with G. Lauzon re:
same.

E-mailing A. Slavens re: Tarion security deposit re: Queen's Corner.

Emailing J. Merryweather; e-mailing M. Richardson (Kartelle) re: outstanding
costs.



Goodman
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Barristers & Solicitors

LLP Bay Adelaide Centre
S 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400

Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #679089 -- page 2

Date TKID Hours  Description

01/18/17 CEF .10 Correspondence with J. Merryweather.

01/20/17 CEF .70 Attending call with J. Merryweather; reviewing statutory declaration
requested by Tarion; e-mailing H. Schonfeld re: same; preparing billing
summary in preparation for fee allocation analysis.

01/23/17 CEF 110 Meeting with H. Schonfeld; e-mailing A. Slavens re: statutory declaration in
respect of Queen's Corner Claims Process; leaving voicemail for M.
Richardson (Kartelle) re: costs award; e-mailing M. Richardson re: same;
meeting with M. Dunn.

01/24/17 CEF .50  Attending call with Aluvion Law re: costs owed by Kartelle; e-mailing H.
Schonfeld re: same; attending call with E. Apps re: same; e-mailing E. Apps
re: same.

01/25/17 CEF .70 Drafting fee affidavit of H. Schonfeld; attending call with J. Merryweather;
meeting with M. Dunn. ;

01/27/17 CEF 2.10  Meeting with H. Schonfeld re: commissioning fee affidavit; drafting fee
affidavit of B. Empey; reviewing invoices re: same; drafting letter re: Weston
Road.

01/30/17 CEF 1.20  Reviewing correspondence from Tarion re: Queen's Corner Corp.; emailing
clients re: same; drafting letter to Meridian re: same; reviewing and revising
fee affidavit of B. Empey; compiling same; reviewing summary of billings for
fee approval; emailing J. Merryweather re: summary of Schedule C Property
proceeds for R. Fisher. '

01/31/17 CEF 1.50  Correspondence with R. Fisher; reviewing motion materials re: Schedule C
proceeds; reviewing order re: sale of Prince Edward; emailing M. Dunn and J.
Merryweather re: same; reviewing correspondence from S. Roy and N.
Walton to court of appeal re: dismissal of Walton appeal.

OUR FEE $5,231.00
TKID NAME HOURS RATE TOTAL
KEH Herlin, Ken 1.10 hrs $950.00 $1,045.00
CEF Fox, Carlie 9.10 hrs $450.00 $4,095.00
GLL Lauzon, Gloria 0.20 hrs $455.00 $91.00
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Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #679089 -- page 3

TKID NAME HOURS RATE TOTAL
$5,231.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Conference Calls 192
Search - Sub 32.70
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $40.62
TOTAL FEES ON THIS INVOICE $5,231.00
HST ON FEES 680.03
NON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 0.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 40.62
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE $40.62
HST ON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENT 5.28
TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLLARS) $5,956.93
TRUST FUNDS $248,341.63
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Barristers & Solicitors
LLP Bay Adelaide Centre
Goodman S 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Telephone: 416.979.2211

Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #679089 -- page 4

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMANS LLP

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 0.80% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.



This is Exhibit “B” referred to in the
affidavit of Brian Empey
sworn before me, this 25"

day of September, 2017.

(5L

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits

Christopher Patrick James Baxter, a
Commissioner, etc., Province of Ontario,
while a Student-at-Law.

Expires April 14, 2019.
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Barristers & Solicitors

LLP Bay Adelaide Centre

GOOdmanS 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400

Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

February 28, 2017

Schonfeld Inc.

3000 North Tower, TD Centre
77 King St. W.

PO Box 85

Toronto, ON

Canada MSK 1G8

ATTENTION: S. Harlan Schonfeld

OUR FILE NO. SFDI 140074

OUR INVOICE NO. 680628

GST/HST REGISTRATION NO. R119422962
Re: Manager

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED
MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Date TKID Hours  Description
02/02/17 CEF .10 Correspondence with R. Fisher.
02/06/17 CEF 1.80  Correspondence from J. Merryweather; reviewing 2016 dockets for fee

allocation motion.

02/07/17 CEF 3.10  Correspondence to Messrs. Belluz and Zinman re: Weston; reviewing 2016
dockets for fee allocation motion; correspondence with J. Merryweather;
meeting with M. Dunn re: Dupont mortgagee claim.

02/07/17 ACH 3.10  Researching case law re: enforcement of contractual cost indemnity; drafting
e-mail to C. Fox and M. Dunn re: enforcement of contractual cost indemnity
in receivership.

02/08/17 CEF 2.40  Reviewing legal research re: Dupont Mortgagees' entitlement to enforcement
costs; reviewing orders dismissing Dupont Mortgagees challenges to
Manager's charge; drafting notice of disallowance; reviewing and revising
2016 fee allocation.

02/09/17 CEF .60  Correspondence with J. Merryweather; drafting 47th Report of the Manager.

02/10/17 MSD .80  Reviewing Dupont mortgagee claim and drafting response; reviewing law
relevant to same.

02/13/17 CEF 90  Attending call with J. Merryweather; meeting with M. Dunn; drafting report.
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Barristers & Solicitors

LLP Bay Adelaide Centre

GOOdmanS 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400

Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #680628 -- page 2

Date TKID Hours  Description

02/14/17 CEF 20 Revising Dupont Mortgagee disallowance; emailing J. Merryweather re:
same.

02/16/17 CEF 20 Reviewing correspondence from N. Walton re: motion for extension of time
to perfect appeal; reviewing motion materials re: same.

02/18/17 CEF .70 Drafting 47th Report of the Manager.

02/21/17 CEF 4.10  Drafting 47th Report of the Manager; reviewing Applicant's responding
motion record re: Waltons' motion to extend time to perfect appeal;
exchanging emails with B. Zinman re: Weston claim; exchanging emails with
J. Merryweather.

02/22/17 CEF 1.20  Reviewing and revising 47th Report of the Manager; attending call with J.
Merryweather re: same.

02/23/17 CEF .10 Correspondence with J. Merryweather.

02/24/17 MSD 2.20  Reviewing and revising 47th report re: various issues; discussions with C. Fox
re: same; reviewing materials re: motion returnable February 27 to extend
time; emails with court re: adjournment.

02/24/17 CEF 1.50  Reviewing and revising 47th Report; meeting with M. Dunn.

OUR FEE $10,544.50
TKID NAME HOURS RATE TOTAL
MSD Dunn, Mark 3.00 hrs $675.00 $2,025.00
CEF Fox, Carlie 16.90 hrs $450.00 $7,605.00
ACH Harmes, Andrew 3.10 hrs $295.00 $914.50

$10,544.50

DISBURSEMENTS

Copies 0.00
Delivery - Courier 21.49
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $21.49



Goodmans

365

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #680628 -- page 3

TOTAL FEES ON THIS INVOICE $10,544.50
HST ON FEES 1,370.79
NON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 0.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 21.49
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE $21.49
HST ON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENT 2.79
TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLLARS) $11,939.57
TRUST FUNDS $248,357.95

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMANS LLP

/ 7 -

E. & O. E.
BFE [/

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 0.80% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.



This is Exhibit “C” referred to in the
affidavit of Brian Empey
sworn before me, this 25"

day of September, 2017.

(et

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits

Chnsto_ph_er Patrick James Baxter, a
Commissioner, etc., Province of Ontario,
whilea Student-at-Law.

Expires April 14, 2019,
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Barristers & Solicitors
LLP Bay Adelaide Centre
GOO m a] 1S 333 Bay Strest, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Telephone: 416.979.2211

Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

March 30, 2017

Schonfeld Inc.

3000 North Tower, TD Centre
77 King St. W.

PO Box 85

Toronto, ON

Canada M5SK 1G8

ATTENTION: S. Harlan Schonfeld

OUR FILE NO. SFDI 140074

OUR INVOICE NO. 682386

GST/HST REGISTRATION NO. R119422962
Re: Manager

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED
MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Date TKID Hours  Description

02/28/17 CEF 2.20  Correspondence with S. Roy, R. Fisher and J. Merryweather re: payment of
tax liabilities owing by United Empire Lands and Prince Edward Properties;
reviewing endorsement of Justice Epstein re: Applicants' motion for security
for costs of the Respondents' appeal; emailing clients re: same; reviewing
NOAs re: United Empire Lands; exchanging emails with M. Dunn re: same.

03/01/17 CEF 1.40  Emailing B. Zinman and R. Belucci re: Weston claim; correspondence re:
Waltons' motion for extension of time; meeting with M. Dunn ré: same.

03/02/17 MSD 1.50  Preparing for hearing of motion for extension of time; attending same;
drafting and revising 47th report as it relates to Wallach/Zimmerman fees.

03/03/17 CEF .80  Correspondence with Commercial List and service list re: scheduling
Manager's motion; preparing hearing request form; correspondence with M.
Brzezinski re: Dupont HST indemnity.

03/06/17 CEF .70 Correspondence with R. Fisher re: UEL tax filings; meeting with M. Dunn re:
motion returnable April 12, 2017; correspondence with J. Merryweather re:
Weston.

03/07/17 CEF 20 Reviewing correspondence from B. Zinman; reviewing correspondence from

M. Brzezinski re: Dupont; e-mailing J. Merryweather re: same.
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Barristers & Solicitors

LLP Bay Adelaide Centre

GOOdmanS 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400

Date

03/08/17
03/08/17

03/09/17

03/09/17
03/13/17

03/14/17

03/14/17
03/15/17

03/16/17

03/16/17
03/19/17
03/20/17
03/21/17

03/22/17
03/22/17

TKID

BFE
CEF

BFE

CEF
MSD

MSD

CEFR
MSD

MSD

CEF

MSD

MSD

MSD

MSD
BFE

Hours

20
.70

20

40
70

3.30

30
5.20

2.50

30

1.30

1.50

.80

1.80
.20

Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #682386 -- page 2

Description

Reviewing and commenting on draft fee affidavit.

Reviewing and revising fee affidavit of B. Empey; exchanging emails with B.
Empey re: same; reviewing and revising 47th Report.

Meeting with C. Fox to swear fee affidavit and for update on Coust
proceedings.

Meeting with B. Empey re: commissioning fee affidavit and file update.

Reviewing emails re: Court of Appeal Motion of Extension; drafting and -
revising 47th report.

Telephone call with J. Merryweather re: motion material required; revising
47th report and sending same to C. Fox; drafting report re: I. Wallach and 1.
Zimmerman; preparing for oral argument of motion for extension of time to
perfect appeal.

Meeting with M. Dunn re: 47th Report; reviewing trust balances.

Preparing for and attending motion re: extension of time; drafting 47th report;
reviewing correspondence with I. Wallach and 1. Zimmerman re: fees and
drafting report re: same; reviewing trust balances.

Drafting and revising 47th report; emailing client re: same; reviewing material
provided re: N. Walton funding; drafting Notice of Motion re: 47th report;
receiving and reviewing decision re: appeal of the Respondents.

Reviewing dismissal of N. Walton appeal; attending call with B: Zinman re:
Weston.

Revising 47th report per comments of J. Merryweather; emails to J.
Merryweather.

Drafting motion materials re: 47th report; revising 47th report; gathering
materials relevant to same.

Finalizing 47th report and assembling exhibits; meeting with H. Schonfeld re:
report. ;

Drafting Order and Notice of Motion re: 47th Report.

Reviewing Court of Appeal decisions and forward same by email to
Schonfeld.
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Barristers & Solicitors

LLP Bay Adelaide Centre

GOOdmanS 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400

Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #682386 -- pége 3

Date TKID Hours  Description

03/24/17 MSD 1.20  Drafting Order re: 47th report; emails with J. Merryweather re: same; drafting
Notice of Motion; telephone call with D. Glatt. :

03/26/17 CEF 3.60  Drafting factum re: 47th Report; compiling book of authorities re: same;
drafting notice of motion.

03/27/17 CEF 1.30  Correspondence with counsel to the Dupont Morigagees; reviewing and
revising Notice of Motion; reviewing and revising motion record; serving
same; correspondence re: Weston Road claims.

03/28/17 CEF 30  Reviewing Schedule B GST recovery summary.

OUR FEE $19,410.00
TKID NAME HOURS RATE TOTAL
BFE Empey, Brian F. 0.60 hrs $925.00 ) $555.00
MSD Dunn, Mark 19.80 hrs $675.00 $13,365.00
CEE Fox, Carlie 12.20 hrs $450.00 : $5,490.00

$19,410.00

DISBURSEMENTS

Copies 144.75

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS - $144.75

TOTAL FEES ON THIS INVOICE 4 $19,410.00

HST ON FEES 2,523.30

NON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 0.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 144.75

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE $144.75
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Barristers & Solicitors

LLP Bay Adelaide Centre

GOOdmanS 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400

Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #682386 -- page 4

HST ON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENT 18.82

TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLLARS) $22,096.87
TRUST FUNDS - $248,357.95

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMANS LLP

)
/" " J . 4 E
%}’(L«,L /1 ‘/7 -

E. & O.E.
BFE /

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 0.80% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.



This is Exhibit “D” referred to in the
affidavit of Brian Empey
sworn before me, this 25"

day of September, 2017.

CE XL

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits

Christopher Patrick James Baxter, a

Commissioner, etc., Province i
i 2 5 ey of
while a Student-at-Law, Ontario,

Expires April 14, 2019,
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Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre

GOOdmang 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400

Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

April 28, 2017
Schonfeld Inc.
3000 North Tower, TD Centre
77 King St. W.
PO Box 85
Toronto, ON
Canada M5K 1GS8

ATTENTION: S. Harlan Schonfeld

OUR FILE NO. SFDI 140074

OUR INVOICE NO. 684297

GST/HST REGISTRATION NO. R119422962
Re: Manager

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED
MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Date TKID Hours  Description

03/27/17 MSD .50  Reviewing and revising Notice of Motion re: 47th report; emails with client
re: various issues.

03/29/17 CEF 30  Correspondence with J. Merryweather re: Weston claims; attending call with
J. Merryweather re: Manager's motion returnable April 12, 2017 and GST
refund issues.

03/30/17 CEF .50  Attending call with J. Merryweather and M. Dunn re: GST refunds and Rose
and Thistle invoices to Schedule B Companies.

03/31/17 BFE .20  Receiving and reviewing correspondence from mortgagee at 355 Weston
Road; emails discussing same.

03/31/17 CEF .20 Reviewing correspondence re: Weston Road claims.

04/03/17 MSD .50 Call with client re: 355 Weston; reviewing motion material and Factum.

04/03/17 CEF 1.00  Drafting letter to Bianchi Presta re: Weston claims; attending call with H.
Schonfeld, J. Merryweather, M. Dunn re: same.

04/04/17 CEF .80  Meeting with M. Dunn re: next steps; reviewing and revising factum.

04/07/17 CEF 30 Finalizing factum and book of authorities of the Manager re: 47th Report;

serving same.
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Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre

GOOdmang 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400

Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #684297 -- page 2

Date TKID Hours  Description
04/11/17 MSD .70 Reviewing draft Order and motion material; discussion with C. Fox; call with
H. Schonfeld.
04/11/17 CEF 90  Meeting with M. Dunn re: motion for approval of fees and allocation;
reviewing and revising draft order re: same; emailing service list and J.
Merryweather re: same.
04/12/17 CEF 1.80  Attending at the Superior Court of Justice re: motion for approval of fees and
activities.
04/13/17 CEF 20  Corresponding with J. Merryweather re: Dupont; emailing service list re:
issued order.
04/17/17 CEF 20  Attending call with J. Merryweather re: Fraser Properties security agreement;
reviewing general security agreement.
04/26/17 MSD 40  Call with S. Roy re: tracing and other issues; reviewing I. Wallach fee issue.
OUR FEE $4,392.50
TKID NAME HOURS RATE TOTAL
BFE Empey, Brian F. 0.20 hrs $925.00 $185.00
MSD Dunn, Mark 2.10 hrs $675.00 $1,417.50
CEF Fox, Carlie 6.20 hrs $450.00 $2,790.00
$4,392.50
DISBURSEMENTS
Parking/ Cab / Mileage 4.96
Copies 103.75
Search - EDD 28.00
Meals 17.86
Process Server 280.00
Computer Searches - Westlaw Carswell 112,50
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $547.07
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Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #684297 -- page 3

TOTAL FEES ON THIS INVCICE $4,392.50
HST ON FEES 571.03
NON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 0.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 547.07
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE $547.07
HST ON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENT 71.12
TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLLARS) $5.581.72
TRUST FUNDS $248,396.76

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMANS LLP

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 0.80% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.



This is Exhibit “E” referred to in the
affidavit of Brian Empey
sworn before me, this 25"

day of September, 2017.

CRA

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits

gn{rri]srqpner Patrick James Baxter, a
ommissioner, etc., Province of Ontari
while a Student-at-Law, .
Expires April 14, 2019.
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Barristers & Solicitors
LLP Bay Adelaide Centre - West Tower
GOOd] N a] ] S 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Telephone: 416.979.2211

Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

May 26, 2017
Schonfeld Inc.
3000 North Tower, TD Centre
77 King St. W.
PO Box 85
Toronto, ON
Canada M5SK 1G8

ATTENTION: S. Harlan Schonfeld

OUR FILE NO. SFDI 140074

OUR INVOICE NO. 685303

GST/HST REGISTRATION NO. R119422962
Re: Manager

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED
MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Date TKID Hours  Description

05/01/17 CEF 20 Meeting with S. Stothart re: motion for repayment of monies posted to
discharge construction liens.

05/04/17 CEF 90  Emailing B. Zinman re: Weston; drafting correspondence to counsel to Laser
Heating and Firm Capital re: 30 Hazelton; correspondence with A.
Blumenfeld re: orders.

05/11/17 CEF 2.50  Attending call with J. Fried re: 30 Hazelton; drafting motion materials re:
same; reviewing and revising affidavit re: same; exchanging emails with G.
Lauzon and S. Stothart re: same.

05/11/17 GLL .30 Numerous email; download documents from Teraview and provide copy to C.
Fox.

05/16/17 CEF .80  Reviewing and revising motion record re: 30 Hazelton; emailing counsel to
Laser and counsel to Firm Capital re: same; emailing J. Merryweather re:
same.

05/19/17 CEF .10 Reviewing correspondence from R. Fisher re: appeal factum citations; calling

D. Glatt re: appeal book and compendium.

05/23/17 CEF .60  Emailing B. Zinman and A. Blumenfeld re: 30 Hazelton; attending call with
E. Creelman re: documentary requests from counsel to the Levytams;
emailing J. Merryweather re: same and re: payment to Laser in respect of 30
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Barristers & Solicitors
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Bay Adelaide Centre - West Tower
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234

goodmans.ca

Invoice #685303 -- page 2

Hazelton; emailing B. Zinman re: payment to Laser in respect of 30 Hazelton.

05/24/17 CEF 1.00  Attending call with E. Judges re: appeal materials; attending call with A.
Blumenfeld re: 30 Hazelton; reviewing and revising release by Laser re: 30

Hazelton action.

OUR FEE $2,881.50
TKID NAME HOURS RATE TOTAL
CEF Fox, Carlie 6.10 hrs $450.00 $2,745.00
GLL Lauzon, Gloria 0.30 hrs $455.00 $136.50

$2,881.50

DISBURSEMENTS

Process Server 75.00
Search - Sub 17.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $92.00

TOTAL FEES ON THIS INVOICE $2,881.50

HST ON FEES 374.60

NON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 0.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 92.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE $92.00

HST ON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENT 11.96

TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLLARS) $3,360.06
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Barristers & Solicitors
LLP Bay Adelaide Centre - West Tower
GOOd] N al | S 333 Bay Strest, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Telephone: 416.979.2211

Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #685303 -- page 3

TRUST FUNDS $248,440.99

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMANS LLP

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 0.80% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.
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This is Exhibit “F” referred to in the
affidavit of Brian Empey
sworn before me, this 25™

day of September, 2017.

e AL

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits

Christopher Patrick James Baxter, a
Commissioner, etc., Province of Ontario,
while a Student-at-Law,

Expires April 14, 2019,
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Barristers & Solicitors
LLP Bay Adelaide Centre
GOOdm aI ] S 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Telephone: 416.979.2211

Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

June 29, 2017

Schonfeld Inc.

3000 North Tower, TD Centre
77 King St. W.

PO Box 85

Toronto, ON

Canada MS5K 1G8

ATTENTION: S. Harlan Schonfeld

OUR FILE NO. SFDI 140074

OUR INVOICE NO. 687440

GST/HST REGISTRATION NO. R119422962
Re: Manager

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED
MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Date TKID Hours  Description

05/25/17 CEF .10 Emailing Chaitons re: release by Laser re: 30 Hazelton.

05/26/17 CEF 30 Emailing B. Zinman and A. Blumenfeld re: 30 Hazelton; meeting with S.
Stothart re: same.

05/30/17 MSD 1.50  Telephone call with A. Blumenfeld re: appeal and Schedule "C" issues;
reviewing facta re: appeal.

05/30/17 CEF 40  Emailing A. Blumenfeld re: 30 Hazelton; attending call with B. Zinman re:
same.

05/31/17 MSD 1.70  Reviewing material re: appeal; preparing for same.

06/01/17 MSD 6.20  Preparing for appeal; reviewing facts; calls and emails with S. Roy re: Cecil
and other matters; reviewing material re: potential Schedule C claims process.

06/01/17 CEF .30 Preparing materials for hearing of Applicants' appeal.

06/02/17 MSD 6.60  Preparing for and attending hearing at the Ontario Court of Appeal re: Order

of Newbould, J. dated September 23, 2016.
06/02/17 GLL .50  Update statement of receipt and disbursement of funds.

06/06/17 MSD .80  Reviewing statement of receipts and disbursements; drafting next steps email.



Goodman

381

Barristers & Solicitors

LLP Bay Adelaide Centre
S 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #687440 -- page 2

Date TKID Hours  Description

06/07/17 MSD .50  Reviewing Handelman fee motion; instructions to C. Fox re: same.

06/07/17 CEF 40  Meeting with M. Dunn re: Handelman fee motion.

06/08/17 MSD 1.20  Reviewing motion material re: S. Handelman fees; preparing responding
material; email to S. Roy.

06/11/17 CEF .50  Reviewing motion record re: Handelman fees; drafting 48th report re: same.

06/12/17 CEF .90  Drafting 48th report re: Handelman fee allocation.

06/13/17 MSD 1.80  Reviewing and revising report re: Handelman fees; reviewing issues re:
amounts held for N. Walton contributions.

06/13/17 CEF 1.10  Reviewing and revising 48th report of the Manager re: Handelman fees
(Fraser); correspondence with J. Merryweather re: same.

06/14/17 MSD 1.20  Finalizing and serving report; discussions with C. Fox; reviewing
correspondence from L. Wallach.

06/14/17 CEF 1.30  Reviewing and revising 48th Report of the Manager; preparing responding
motion record; attending calls with J. Merryweather and H. Schonfeld re:
same; attending call with L. Wallach; reviewing Handelman's factum.

06/15/17 MSD 20  Reviewing factum and authorities re: Handelman fee motion.

06/16/17 MSD .50  Reviewing faction of Handelman group and preparing for oral argument.

06/19/17 MSD 420  Preparing for and attending motion re: Handelman fee issues.

OUR FEE $20,432.50
TKiD NAME HOURS RATE TOTAL
MSD Dunn, Mark 26.40 hrs $675.00 - $17,820.00
CEF Fox, Carlie 5.30 hrs $450.00 $2,385.00
GLL Lauzon, Gloria 0.50 hrs $455.00 - $227.50

$20,432.5¢0

DISBURSEMENTS

Copies

74.50
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Barristers & Solicitors
LLP Bay Adelaide Centre
GOOdII ] aI ] S 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
. Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Telephone: 416.979.2211

Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #687440 -- page 3

Process Server 75.50
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $150.00
TOTAL FEES ON THIS INVOICE $20,432.50
HST ON FEES 2,656.23
NON TAXARLE DISBURSEMENTS 0.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 150.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE £150.00
HST ON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENT 19.50
TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLLARS) $23.258.23

TRUST FUNDS $248,460.26
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: Barristers & Solicitors
LLP Bay Adelaide Centre
GOOdmanS 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Telephone: 416.979.2211

Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #687440 -- page 4

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMARNS LLP

This invoice may not reflect all time aud disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 0.80% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursemeiits calculated one menth from the date this invoice is delivered.
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This is Exhibit “G” referred to in the

affidavit of Brian Empey

sworn before me, this 25™

day of September, 2017.

Cet

A Commissibner for Taking Affidavits

Chnstqpher Patrick James Baxter, a
Commissioner, etc., Province of Ontario,
while a Student-at-Law.

Expires April 14, 2019,
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Schonfeld Inc.

3000 North Tower, TD Centre
77 King St. W.

PO Box 85

Toronto, ON

Canada MS5K 1G8

ATTENTION: S. Harlan Schonfeld

Re: Manager
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Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre - West Tower
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

July 31, 2017
OUR FILE NO. SFDI 140074
OUR INVOICE NO. 689012

GST/HST REGISTRATION NO. R119422962

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED

MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Date TKID Hours  Description

07/05/17 MSD 30 Discussions with C. Fox re: 30 Hazelton issues.

07/05/17 CEF 20 Corresponding with Chaitons re: 30 Hazelton motion.

07/06/17 MSD 2.20  Reviewing motion material re: 30 Hazelton; reviewing status of issues

identified by J. Merryweather: updating email with and call to J.
Merryweather; reviewing material re: distributions.

07/06/17 CEF 2.50  Revising motion record re: 30 Hazelton; serving same; emailing B. Zinman
re: Weston Rd.; attending calls with J. Merryweather and M. Dunn re:

outstanding issues.

07/07/17 MSD 1.30  Reviewing motion material and J. Merryweather analysis re: interim
distributions; drafting report re: same.

07/10/17 MSD 230  Reviewing material re: distribution; drafting report re: same.

07/11/17 MSD 3.00  Telephone call with S. Roy re: distributions; telephone call with J.

Merryweather re: same; reviewing tracing report; reviewing tracing
documents sent by G. Moulton in 2015.

07/12/17 MSD 2.80  Reviewing tracing analysis conducted in January 2015; drafting report re:
tracing and equity distributions; locating and reviewing documents relevant to

same.



Goodman
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Barristers & Solicitors

LLp Bay Adelaide Centre - West Tower
S 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #689012 -- page 2

Date TKID Hours  Description

07/14/17 MSD 2.20  Drafting report re: distributions and other relief; further reviewing tracing
documents.

07/17/17 MSD 1.30  Reviewing material relevant to distribution and drafting report; reviewing
jurisprudence relevant to distribution proposal.

07/24/17 MSD 1.70  Reviewing material relevant to distribution issue; reviewing material relevant
to tax loss sale; drafting report re: same.

07/26/17 MSD 1.50  Drafting report re: distribution; discussions with C. Fox re: tax loss issue;
reviewing orders relevant to same.

07/27/17 MSD 3.20  Telephone call with J. Merryweather re: tax losses, claims processes and
distributions; reviewing material re: same; drafting report re: distributions.

07/27/17 CEF 1.10  Attending call with J. Merryweather and M. Dunn re: claims process with
respect to tax losses; meeting with M. Dunn re: same.

07/28/17 MSD 1.70  Drafting report re: distributions.

OUR FEE $17,572.50
TKID NAME HOURS RATE TOTAL
MSD Dunn, Mark 23.50 hrs $675.00 $15,862.50
CEF Fox, Carlie 3.80 hrs $450.00 $1,710.00

$17,572.50

DISBURSEMENTS

Transportation 15.16
Copies 21.00
Meals 36.70
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $72.86

TOTAL FEES ON THIS INVOICE

$17,572.50
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Goodmans
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Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre - West Tower
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #689012 -- page 3

HST ON FEES 2,284.43
NON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 0.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 72.86
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE $72.86
HST ON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENT 9.47
TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLLARS) $19,939.26
TRUST FUNDS $248,477.78

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMANS LLP

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 0.80% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.
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This is Exhibit “H” referred to in the
affidavit of Brian Empey
sworn before me, this 25"

day of September, 2017.

d

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits

Christopher Patrick James Baxter, a
Commissioner, etc., Province of Ontario,
while a Student-at-Law.

Expires Aprit 14, 2019.
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Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre - West Tower
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Schonfeld Inc.
3000 North Tower, TD Centre
77 King St. W.

PO Box 85

Toronto, ON

Canada M5SK 1G8

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

ATTENTION: S. Harlan Schonfeld

Re: Manager

August 31, 2017
OUR FILE NO. SFDI 140074
OUR INVOICE NO. 690255

GST/HST REGISTRATION NO. R119422962

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED
MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Date TKID Hours
07/30/17 CEF .10
07/31/17 CEF .50
08/01/17 CEF 40
08/02/17 CEF .20
08/03/17 MSD S0
08/03/17 CEF .20
08/15/17 MSD .10
08/16/17 CEF .50
08/17/17 CEF .10
08/22/17 MSD 1.80

Description

Reviewing orders re: Tisdale funds; emailing G. Lauzon re: payment of same.

Attending to entering order re: 30 Hazelton; correspondence with R. Fisher
and J. Merryweather re: United Empire Lands; correspondence with S. Roy.

Reviewing and revising notarial certificate and affidavit re: release of funds
re: 30 Hazelton.

Finalizing affidavit and notarial certificate for accountant of superior court re:
30 Hazelton; correspondence with S. Roy and J. Merryweather.

Discussions with C. Fox; drafting report re: distribution.
Attending call with J. Merryweather; allocating dockets.
Reviewing Order provided by S. Roy.

Attending call with commercial list re: scheduling fee allocation motion;
emailing service list re: same; correspondence re: payment of Tisdale funds;
revising hearing request form.

Reviewing correspondence from J. Merryweather re: next Manager's report
and motion.

Telephone call with client re: motion to discharge and other issues; emails



Goodman
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Barristers & Solicitors

LLP Bay Adelaide Centre - West Tower
S 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #690255 -- page 2

Date TKID Hours  Description
with counsel for the applicants; telephone call with S. Roy; drafting report.

08/22/17 CEF 3.80  Correspondence with L. Wallach re: payment of Tisdale funds; reviewing
draft discharge order; attending call with H, Schonfeld, J. Merryweather and
M. Dunn re: discharge motion; drafting report re: same.

08/23/17 MSD 1.30  Emails with S. Roy; discussions with C. Fox; reviewing and revising 49th
report; telephone call with J. Merryweather re: issues relevant to report.

08/23/17 CEF 1.60  Emailing C. Yung re: serving motion; attending call with S. Roy and C. Yung
re: discharge motion; attending call with M. Dunn and J. Merryweather;
reviewing and revising 49th Report of the Manager re: discharge in respect of
Weston, Riverdale, and Northern Dancer.

08/24/17 MSD 1.40  Reviewing and revising report; reviewing and providing comments on Notice
of Motion; telephone call with client; emails with client and C. Fox.

08/24/17 CEF 4.50  Reviewing and revising 49th report re: discharge of Weston, Riverdale and
Northern Dancer; revising hearing request; attending call with H. Schonfeld;
J. Merryweather and M. Dunn re: discharge motion; compiling appendices to
49th report; reviewing applicants' notice of motion and draft order.

08/25/17 CEF .50  Correspondence with Commercial List re: scheduling Manager's motion and
judicial conflicts; correspondence with C. Yung re: serving creditors lists.

OUR FEE $9,022.50
TKID NAME HOURS RATE TOTAL
MSD Dunn, Mark 5.10 hrs $675.00 $3,442.50
CEF Fox, Carlie 12.40 hrs $450.00 $5,580.00

$9,022.50

DISBURSEMENTS

Copies 317.50
Delivery - Courier 3.30
Process Server 140.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $460.80
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Barristers & Solicitors
LLp Bay Adelaide Centre - West Tower
G()Od] N a] | S 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario MbH 2S7
Telephone: 416.979.2211

Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #690255 -- page 3

TOTAL FEES ON THIS INVOICE $9,022.50
HST ON FEES 1,172.93
NON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 0.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 460.80
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE $460.80
HST ON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENT 59.90
TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLLARS) $10,716.13
TRUST FUNDS $234,367.67

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMANS LLP

. & O. E.
BFE /

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 0.80% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.



This is Exhibit “I” referred to in the
affidavit of Brian Empey
sworn before me, this 25™

day of September, 2017.

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavit

ggristqpher Patrick James Baxter, 3
mmissioner, etc. , Province of Qntario,
while a Student-at-Law, .
Expires April 14, 2019,
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Goodmans LLP
Billing Summary

File 140074 (Re: Manager) Jan. 1, 2017 - Aug. 31, 2017
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Billing History
Invoice# Invoice Date Fees Cost Tax Total
679089 2/6/2017 5,231.00 40.62 685.31 5,956.93
680628 2/28/2017 10,544.50 21.49 1,373.58 11,939.57
682386 3/30/2017 19,410.00 144.75 2,542.12 22,096.87
684297 4/28/2017 4,392.50 547.07 642.15 5,5681.72
685303 5/26/2017 2,881.50 92.00 386.56 3,360.06
687440 6/29/2017 20,432.50 150.00 2,675.73 23,258.23
689012 7/31/2017 17,572.50 72.86 2,293.90 19,939.26
690255 8/31/2017 9,022.50 460.80 1,232.83 10,716.13
Total $ 89,487.00 $ 152959 $ 11,832.18 $ 102,848.77
Timekeeper Summary - Billed
TK ID Full Name Position Bill Hours  Bill Amount Bill Rate
KEH Ken Herlin Partner 1.1 1,045.00 950
BFE Brian F. Empey  Partner 0.8 740.00 925
MSD Mark Dunn Partner 79.9 53,932.50 675
CEF Carlie Fox Associate 72.0 32,400.00 450
ACH Andrew Harmes  Articlg Student 3.1 914.50 295
GLL Gloria Lauzon Law Clerk 1.0 455.00 455
Total 1579 $ 89,487.00
Average Billing Rate $ 567




10.
11.
12.
13.
14.
15.
16.
17.
18.
19.
20.
21.
22.
23.

24,

SCHEDULE “B” COMPANIES

Twin Dragons Corporation

Bannockburn Lands Inc. / Skyline - 1185 Eglinton Avenue Inc.

Wynford Professional Centre Ltd.
Liberty Village Properties Inc.
Liberty Village Lands Inc.
Riverdale Mansion Ltd.

Royal Agincourt Corp.

Hidden Gem Development Inc.
Ascalon Lands Ltd.

Tisdale Mews Inc.

Lesliebrook Holdings Ltd.
Lesliebrook Lands Ltd.

Fraser Properties Corp.

Fraser Lands Ltd.

Queen’s Corner Corp.
Northern Dancer Lands Ltd.

Dupont Developments Ltd.

Red Door Development Inc. and Red Door Lands Ltd.

Global Mills Inc.

Donalda Developments Ltd.
Salmon River Properties Ltd.
Cityview Industrial Ltd.
Weston Lands Ltd.

Double Rose Developments Ltd.

394



25.
26.
217.
28.
29.
30.
31.

32.

Skyway Holdings Ltd.

West Mall Holdings Ltd.
Royal Gate Holdings Ltd.
Dewhurst Developments Ltd.

Eddystone Place Inc.

Richmond Row Holdings Ltd.

El-Ad Limited

165 Bathurst Inc.
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SCHEDULE “C” PROPERTIES

3270 American Drive, Mississauga, Ontario

0 Luttrell Ave., Toronto, Ontario

2 Kelvin Avenue, Toronto, Ontario

346 Jarvis Street, Suites A, B, C, E and F, Toronto, Ontario
1 William Morgan Drive, Toronto, Ontario

324 Prince Edward Drive, Toronto, Ontario

24 Ceclil Street, Toronto, Ontario

30 and 30A Hazelton Avenue, Toronto, Ontario

777 St. Clarens Avenue, Toronto, Ontario

252 Carlton Street and 478 Parliament Street, Toronto, Ontario
66 Gerrard Street East, Toronto, Ontario

2454 Bayview Avenue, Toronto, Ontario

319-321 Carlaw, Toronto, Ontario

260 Emerson Ave., Toronto, Ontario

44 Park Lane Circle, Toronto, Ontario

19 Tennis Crescent, Toronto, Ontario

646 Broadview, Toronto, Ontario

396
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DBDC SPADINA LTD., et al NORMA WALTON, et al Court File No. CV-13-10280-00CL
Applicants Respondents

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
Commercial List

Proceeding commenced at Toronto

AFFIDAVIT OF BRIAN EMPEY
(Sworn September 25, 2017)

GOODMANS LLP

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre

333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Canada M5H 2S7

Brian Empey LSUCH#: 30640G
Mark S. Dunn LSUCH#: 55510L
Tel: (416) 979-2211
Fax: (416) 979-1234

Lawyers for The Manager

6738004
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Schedule B - Use of Funding from 368230 Ontario

TOTAL Professional Total Funding Interest Reallocated Final Interest
18-Dec-13 3-Jan-14 14-Jan-14 21-Feb-14 12-Mar-14 26-Mar-14 7-Apr-14 22-Apr-14 FUNDING Fee Reallocation and Fees Allocation Interest Allocation
$ 405,000.00 $ 804,000.00 $ 143,000.00 $ 390,000.00  $ 391,000.00 $ 26,700.00 $ 75,000.00 $ 444,000.00 $  2,678,700.00
Professional Fees $ 85,250.27 $ 246,833.68 $ - $ 298,988.31 $ 268,748.98 $ - $ - $ - $ 899,821.24 -$ 899,821.24 $ -
Bank Fees $ 20.00 $ 1,013.00 $ 340.00 $ 1800 $ 1300 $ 2450 $ - $ 3350 $ 1,462.00 $ 1,462.00 $ 102.65 -$ 102.65 $ -
Ascalon $ 1,000.00 $ 18,500.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ - $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 29,500.00 $ 16,540.83 $ 46,040.83 $ 2,857.40 $ 46.04 $ 2,903.44
Bannockburn $ 85,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 83,500.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ - $ 2,000.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 178,500.00 $ 19,849.00 $ 198,349.00 $ 14,14588 $ 227.94 $ 14,373.82
Cityview $ - $ 156,400.00 $ 13,500.00 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 169,900.00 $ 4383321 $ 21373321 $ 14,949.78 $ 24089 $ 15,190.67
Dewhurst $ 18,300.00 $ - $ 5500.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 4,000.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 42,800.00 $ 18,19491 $ 60,994.91 $ 3567.74 $ 5749 $ 3,625.23
Donalda $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 42,179.13 $ 42,179.13 $ 244036 $ 3932 $ 2,479.68
Double Rose $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 43,83321 $ 43,83321 $ 2,536.06 $ 4086 $ 2,576.92
Dupont $ 50,000.00 $ 30,000.00 $ 16,000.00 $ 21,000.00 $ 19,000.00 $ - $ 3,000.00 $ 19,000.00 $ 158,000.00 $ 4383321 $ 201,833.21 $ 12,356.29 $ 199.10 $ 12,555.39
Eddystone $ 4,500.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 11,000.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 8,000.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 11,000.00 $ 50,500.00 $ 1157859 $ 62,07859 $ 328672 $ 5296 $ 3,339.68
Fraser Lands $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 2563829 $ 2563829 $ 148336 $ 2390 $ 1,507.26
Fraser Properties $ - $ 61,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 61,000.00 $ 27,29237 $ 88,292.37 $ 6,058.83 $ 9763 $ 6,156.46
Global Mills $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 22,330.13 $ 22,330.13 $ 129196 $ 2082 $ 1,312.78
Hidden Gem $ 2,300.00 $ 16,500.00 $ 3,500.00 $ 2,000.00 $ - $ 26,700.00 $ 7,000.00 $ 35516.76 $ 93,516.76 $ 38,04391 $ 131,560.67 $ 609421 $ 9820 $ 6,192.41
Lesliebrook Holdings $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 34,735.75 $ 34,735.75 $ 2,009.71 $ 3238 $ 2,042.09
Lesliebrook Lands $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
Liberty Village Lands $ 14,700.00 $ - $ 2,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 16,700.00 $ 16,540.83 $ 33,24083 $ 227571 $ 3667 $ 2,312.38
Liberty Village Properties $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 3142758 $ 3142758 $ 181831 $ 2930 $ 1,847.61
Northern Dancer $ 1,500.00 $ 27,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00 $ - $ 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 34,500.00 $ 22,330.13 $ 56,830.13 $ 3,686.23 $ 59.40 $ 3,745.63
Queen's Corner $ 18,500.00 $ 22,000.00 $ 11,000.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 16,000.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 21,000.00 $ 94,500.00 $ 27,29237 $ 12179237 $ 6,857.97 $ 11050 $ 6,968.47
Red Door Developments $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 37,216.87 $ 37,216.87 $ 2,153.26 $ 3470 $ 2,187.96
Red Door Lands $ 1,200.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 1,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ 5,000.00 $ - $ 13,200.00 $ 36,389.82 $ 4958982 $ 2,87333 $ 4630 $ 2,919.63
Richmond Row/165 Bathurst $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 28,000.00 $ - $ 40,000.00 $ 68,000.00 $ 37,216.87 $ 105,216.87 $ 424447 $ 6839 $ 4,312.86
Riverdale Mansion $ 7,800.00 $ 21,000.00 $ 8,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 11,000.00 $ 59,800.00 $ 20,676.05 $ 80,476.05 $ 4,676.16 $ 7535 $ 4,751.51
Royal Agincourt $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 39,697.99 $ 39,697.99 $ 2,296.81 $ 3701 $ 2,333.82
Royal Gate Holdings $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 267,000.00 $ 267,000.00 $ 41,352.08 $ 308,352.08 $ 9,34352 $ 15055 $ 9,494.07
Salmon River Properties $ 4,000.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 4,000.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ - $ 3,000.00 $ 4,000.00 $ 19,000.00 $ 6,616.33 $ 2561633 $ 139231 $ 2243 $ 1,414.74
Skyway $ 5500.00 $ 23,800.00 $ 110,000.00 $ 28,000.00 $ 33,000.00 $ 20,000.00 $ - $ 46,000.00 $ 266,300.00 $ 3225463 $ 298,554.63 $ 16,439.59 $ 26489 $ 16,704.48
Tisdale $ 1,600.00 $ 19,100.00 $ 1,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 600.00 $ 22,300.00 $ 2563829 $ 4793829 $ 3,098.96 $ 4993 $ 3,148.89
Twin Dragons $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 4796841 $ 4796841 $ 277531 $ 4472 $ 2,820.03
West Mall $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 40,525.04 $ 40,525.04 $ 234466 $ 3778 $ 2,382.44
Weston Lands $ 54,500.00 $ 25,000.00 $ 4,500.00 $ - $ - $ 4,000.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 15,000.00 $ 104,000.00 $ 20,676.05 $ 124,676.05 $ 8,293.86 $ 13364 $ 8,427.50
Wynford $ 1,900.00 $ 17,500.00 $ - $ 10,000.00 ($ 10,000.00) $ - $ 4,000.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 28,400.00 $ 28,119.36 $ 56,519.36 $ 340749 $ 5491 $ 3,462.40
Balance not yet used (prior) $ 47,429.73  $ 103,353.32 ($ 136,840.00) $ 13993.69 $ 63,238.02 ($ 87,02450) $ 38,000.00 ($ 42,150.26) $ - $ 2,331.35 -$ 2,331.35 $ -
$ 405,000.00 $ 804,000.00 $ 143,000.00 $ 390,000.00 $ 391,000.00 $ 26,700.00 $ 75,000.00 $ 444,000.00 $ 2,678,700.00 ($ 0.00) $ 2,678,700.00 $ 15349025 $ - $ 153,490.25
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Appendix B
Professional Fee Allocation Analysis
Ability of each company to reimburse for allocated professional costs for January 1, 2016 to August 31, 2017
Funds
Allocated Fees Reimbursed Available for
Company Jan-Dec 2016 Jan-Aug 2017 Total to Date Reimbursement Shortfall
SCHEDULE B COMPANIES
Ascalon 13,349.53 6,100.88 19,450.41 10,800.00 0.00 8,650.41
Bannockburn 10,202.04 490.06 10,692.10 10,202.04 490.06 0.00
Cityview 24,346.80 7,515.52 31,862.32 17,700.00 0.00 14,162.32
Dewhurst 14,193.18 6,151.73 20,344.91 0.00 0.00 20,344.91
Donalda 1,839.31 0.00 1,839.31 0.00 0.00 1,839.31
Double Rose 13,324.22 6,355.13 19,679.35 4,100.00 0.00 15,579.35
Dupont 33,499.76 16,581.73 50,081.49 33,499.76 11,000.00 5,581.73
Eddystone 24,912.27 10,397.30 35,309.57 24,912.27 0.00 10,397.30
Fraser Lands 15,323.57 9,116.67 24,440.24 4,000.00 0.00 20,440.24
Fraser Properties 17,326.25 11,368.12 28,694.37 0.00 0.00 28,694.37
Global Mills 4,267.80 5,339.70 9,607.50 0.00 0.00 9,607.50
Hidden Gem 9,095.87 1,430.07 10,525.94 0.00 0.00 10,525.94
Lesliebrook Holdings 13,236.93 7,162.98 20,399.91 13,236.93 7,162.98 0.00
Lesliebrook Lands 14,127.18 6,069.71 20,196.89 10,300.00 0.00 9,896.89
Liberty Village Lands 15,930.80 6,196.83 22,127.63 7,100.00 0.00 15,027.63
Liberty Village Properties 13,830.61 2,261.33 16,091.94 13,830.61 0.00 2,261.33
Northern Dancer 25,739.02 13,282.28 39,021.30 18,000.00 0.00 21,021.30
Queen's Corner 43,742.75 10,835.55 54,578.30 43,742.75 10,835.55 0.00
Red Door Developments 15,068.96 7,854.89 22,923.85 1,900.00 0.00 21,023.85
Red Door Lands 14,643.69 5,262.95 19,906.64 1,700.00 0.00 18,206.64
Richmond Row/165 Bathurst 11,167.77 2,500.33 13,668.10 11,167.77 2,000.00 500.33
Riverdale Mansion 22,477.29 14,631.35 37,108.64 22,477.29 0.00 14,631.35
Royal Agincourt 16,493.56 6,550.11 23,043.67 16,493.56 6,550.11 0.00
Royal Gate Holdings 15,750.18 6,677.23 22,427.42 15,750.18 6,677.24 0.00
Salmon River Properties 15,137.23 5,758.86 20,896.09 0.00 0.00 20,896.09
Skyway 15,062.34 6,175.09 21,237.43 2,600.00 0.00 18,637.43
Tisdale 15,261.33 21,293.64 36,554.97 15,261.33 21,293.64 0.00
Twin Dragons 16,514.50 7,090.39 23,604.89 16,514.50 7,090.39 0.00
West Mall 9,334.68 4,935.45 14,270.13 0.00 0.00 14,270.13
Weston Lands 23,144.68 16,993.99 40,138.67 23,144.68 2,000.00 14,993.99
Wynford 5,876.71 4,591.38 10,468.09 0.00 0.00 10,468.09
Total Schedule B 504,220.83 236,971.24 741,192.08 338,433.67 75,099.97 327,658.44
SCHEDULE C PROPERTIES
44 Park Lane Circle 9,274.45 0.00 9,274.45 8,000.00 0.00 1,274.45
777 St. Clarens 16,118.00 7,352.90 23,470.91 16,118.00 7,352.91 0.00
260 Emerson 15,662.15 7,339.23 23,001.38 15,662.15 7,339.23 0.00
66 Gerrard 13,245.04 8,581.78 21,826.82 13,245.04 8,581.78 0.00
324 Prince Edward 11,865.35 10,296.56 22,161.91 11,865.35 10,296.56 0.00
1 William Morgan 12,166.46 4,019.92 16,186.38 0.00 0.00 16,186.38
3270 American Drive 16,483.26 11,438.22 27,921.47 16,483.25 11,438.22 0.00
321 Carlaw 12,455.66 7,101.92 19,557.58 4,811.48 0.00 14,746.10
346 Jarvis, Unit A. 16,488.59 5,166.89 21,655.48 16,488.59 5,166.89 0.00
346 Jarvis, Unit B 16,488.59 5,166.89 21,655.48 16,488.59 5,166.89 0.00
346 Jarvis, Unit E 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
346 Jarvis, Unit F 254.25 0.00 254.25 254.25 (0.00) 0.00
2454 Bayview 4,232.56 1,948.09 6,180.65 0.00 0.00 6,180.65
30 Hazelton 19,065.56 13,756.31 32,821.86 19,065.56 13,756.30 0.00
30A Hazelton 16,506.62 9,634.88 26,141.50 16,506.62 9,634.88 0.00
24 Cecil 12,450.64 7,797.84 20,248.48